
Itemized Invoice Packet 
Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority 

Regular Board Meeting 
July 13, 2022





City of Ridgecrest
Attn: Alan Christensen
100 W. California Ave.
Ridgecrest, CA 93555

Professional Services through 5/31/2022

Project #: 2652 Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority

2652-58

07/07/22

Invoice Number:

Invoice Date:

Invoice

Water Resources Management 2022
01 - Meetings & Prep

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $4,621.5019.50 $237.00
Supervisor I $3,965.5019.25 $206.00
Senior Associate $1,024.008.00 $128.00
Associate III $1,248.7511.25 $111.00

$10,859.75Professional Services Subtotal:
Reimbursables Charge

Reproduction (Color) $56.07
Reproduction $4.20

$60.27Reimbursables Subtotal:

$10,920.02Meetings & Prep Subtotal:
02 - Prop 1 / Prop 68 Grant Administration

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Senior Associate $320.002.50 $128.00
Associate III $4,190.2537.75 $111.00
Assistant I $1,960.0020.00 $98.00

$6,470.25Professional Services Subtotal:

$6,470.25Prop 1 / Prop 68 Grant Administration Subtotal:
03 - Grant Review & Application Preparation

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $1,185.005.00 $237.00
Supervisor I $51.500.25 $206.00
Associate III $55.500.50 $111.00
Assistant I $294.003.00 $98.00

$1,586.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$1,586.00Grant Review & Application Preparation Subtotal:
04 - Data Mgmt System Support

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $515.002.50 $206.00
Associate I $762.506.25 $122.00

$1,277.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$1,277.50Data Mgmt System Support Subtotal:
05 - General Project Mgmt



Project #: 2652 2652-58Invoice No:

July 07, 2022

Page 2

05 - General Project Mgmt
Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $1,390.506.75 $206.00
Senior Associate $512.004.00 $128.00
Associate III $249.752.25 $111.00

$2,152.25Professional Services Subtotal:

$2,152.25General Project Mgmt Subtotal:
06 - Model Transfer & Upgrade

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $237.001.00 $237.00
Supervisor I $3,296.0016.00 $206.00
Supervisor II $477.502.50 $191.00

$4,010.50Professional Services Subtotal:
Sub-Contractors Charge

Board of Regents $2,519.12
$2,519.12Sub-Contractors Subtotal:

$6,529.62Model Transfer & Upgrade Subtotal:
07 - Imported Water: Engineering & Analysis

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $4,147.5017.50 $237.00
Supervisor I $2,729.5013.25 $206.00
Senior Associate $256.002.00 $128.00
Associate III $5,550.0050.00 $111.00
GIS Specialist I $75.750.75 $101.00

$12,758.75Professional Services Subtotal:

$12,758.75Imported Water: Engineering & Analysis Subtotal:
09 - Recycled Water

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $669.503.25 $206.00
Associate III $1,332.0012.00 $111.00

$2,001.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$2,001.50Recycled Water Subtotal:
11 - Data Collection, Monitoring & Data Gaps

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $1,236.006.00 $206.00
Supervisor II $191.001.00 $191.00
Associate I $183.001.50 $122.00
Senior Assistant $386.253.75 $103.00

$1,996.25Professional Services Subtotal:
Reimbursables Charge

Permits & Fees $3,120.75
$3,120.75Reimbursables Subtotal:

$5,117.00Data Collection, Monitoring & Data Gaps Subtotal:
12 - Prop 1 SDAC Program Support

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $103.000.50 $206.00



Project #: 2652 2652-58Invoice No:

July 07, 2022

Page 3

12 - Prop 1 SDAC Program Support
Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Associate III $943.508.50 $111.00
$1,046.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$1,046.50Prop 1 SDAC Program Support Subtotal:
14 - Production Reporting, Transient Pool & Fee Support

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $103.000.50 $206.00
GIS Specialist I $50.500.50 $101.00

$153.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$153.50Production Reporting, Transient Pool & Fee Support Subtotal:
18 - Navy/Coso Royalty Fund: FY21 Rose Valley MW Permitting, Bid Doc Support & Dr

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $927.004.50 $206.00
Supervisor II $4,202.0022.00 $191.00
Associate I $183.001.50 $122.00
Technical Illustrator $264.003.00 $88.00

$5,576.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$5,576.00Navy/Coso Royalty Fund: FY21 Rose Valley MW Permitting, Bid Doc Support & Dr
20 - Shallow Well Mitigation Program: Outreach & Impacts Evaluation

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $237.001.00 $237.00
Senior Assistant $103.001.00 $103.00

$340.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$340.00Shallow Well Mitigation Program: Outreach & Impacts Evaluation Subtotal:
21 - General Engineering

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $355.501.50 $237.00
Supervisor I $566.502.75 $206.00
Associate III $166.501.50 $111.00

$1,088.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$1,088.50General Engineering Subtotal:
22 - Coordination with DWR on GSP Review

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $1,066.504.50 $237.00
Supervisor I $566.502.75 $206.00
Senior Associate $704.005.50 $128.00
Associate III $416.253.75 $111.00

$2,753.25Professional Services Subtotal:

$2,753.25Coordination with DWR on GSP Review Subtotal:
23 - Annual Report Preparation

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $948.004.00 $237.00
$948.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$948.00Annual Report Preparation Subtotal:
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25 - Allocation Plan & Rules & Regs on Pumping/Restrictions
Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $948.004.00 $237.00
Senior Associate $64.000.50 $128.00
Associate I $671.005.50 $122.00
Associate III $444.004.00 $111.00

$2,127.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$2,127.00Allocation Plan & Rules & Regs on Pumping/Restrictions Subtotal:
26 - Budget Support

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Senior Associate $64.000.50 $128.00
Assistant I $196.002.00 $98.00

$260.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$260.00Budget Support Subtotal:
27 - Litigation Support

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $2,607.0011.00 $237.00
Supervisor I $1,596.507.75 $206.00
Senior Associate $128.001.00 $128.00
Associate I $244.002.00 $122.00

$4,575.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$4,575.50Litigation Support Subtotal:

Water Resources Management 2022 Subtotal: $67,681.14

$67,681.14*** Invoice Total ***



8

7 07

5 1

Date Units Unit Rate Charge Notes

05/31/2022  28.00 $4.20$0.15

Reimbursables
Description

Reproduction

Reproduction (Color) 05/31/2022  63.00 $56.07$0.89

$60.27Meetings & Prep Sub-Total:

Date Units Unit Rate Charge Notes

Sub-Contractors
Description

Board of Regents 05/31/2022  1.00 $2,519.12$2,519.12

$2,519.12Model Transfer & Upgrade Sub-Total:

Reimbursables
Description Date Units Unit Rate

Permits & Fees 05/06/2022  1.00

Charge Notes

$3,025.00 State Lands application fee$3,025.00

Permits & Fees 05/06/2022  1.00 $95.75 credit card charge for paying for State Lands 

application

$95.75

$3,120.75Data Collection, Monitoring & Data Gaps Sub-Total:





5/25/22, 3:12 PM Capital One

https://myaccounts.capitalone.com/Card/FnHEJpIpVKjIv0PhSNbiJWbIlDVG7xkxpMQcRcHj8fQ=/printTransactionsModal 1/1

In addition to this print view, you can also use Download Transactions to download a range of transactions in
multiple formats.

Statement Ending May 7, 2022 Account Ending in ...2987

DATE DESCRIPTION CATEGORY CARD AMOUNT

May STATE LANDS COMMIS*SVC Other Services Joel B. ... $ .

May STATE LANDS COMMISSION Other Services Joel B. ... $ , .
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Invoice for Stetson Enginners Project # 2652-2002-06

INVOICE TO
INVOICE NUMBER:

Stetson Engineers Inc
Attn:   Accounts   Payable DATE:
2171 East Francisco Blvd., Suite K
San Rafael, CA 94901 AMOUNT:

Terms:

Period Billed

Project #2652-2002-06 From To

Net Amount:  72,000.00  Total  (Not to exceed)

DRI Account #  GR15120  / AWD-06-00000914  /  RC0030
PI :  Bacon, Steve

Cost Elements/Services Current Cumulative

Stetson Engineers Project #2652-2002-06

Salary: Hours Rate Current Cumulative

Bacon, Steve 15.1417 166.37 2,519.12 6,276.72

Chapman, Jenny 0.0000 188.67 0.00 0.00

Saftner, Dan 89.78

Travel: 0.00

Operating: 0.00 0.00

Total 2,519.12 6,276.72

Total Amount Due This Invoice 2,519.12

Budget Amount  Task  01 : 72,000.00     
Invoiced To Date : 6,276.72

Budget  Balance - Task  01 : 65,723.28     

06/10/22
Kathy Rodriguez, Accounting Assistant II Date
(775) 673-7476
          Make Check Payable To:  Board of Regents Mail Check To: Desert Research Institute

Financial  Services  Office
2215 Raggio Parkway
Reno, Nevada    89512-1095

           * Please return Invoice Copy with Check * Tax I.D. # 886000024

 "I certify to the best of my ability that all expenditures reported are for appropriate purposes and in accordance with the provisions of the award document."

CI-06-7147   /  02

06/10/22

$2,519.12

Net 30 Days

Contract/Grant/Agreement/Purchase Order

5/1/2022 5/31/2022



Refund from PlanetBids
 

Receipt #3086-2787
 

 

 

REFUNDED

$285.00
 

DATE ISSUED

May 20, 2022
 

REFUNDED TO

 - 9332
 

 

   

 

 

This email is to confirm that your refund has been issued by
PlanetBids. It can take 10+ days to appear on your statement, if it
takes longer please contact your bank for assistance.

 

 

 

 SUMMARY  

 

 

 

 

 

VendorLine membership (63879)  $295.00
 

 

 

 

Total  $295.00
 

Refunded on May 20, 2022  $285.00
 

Adjusted total  $10.00
 

 

 

 

 

 

   

 

 

If you have any questions, visit our support site at
http://support.planetbids.com/support, contact us at
support@planetbids.com, or call at +1 818-992-1771.

 

 

 

   

 

 Something wrong with the email? View it in your browser.  

 

 

You're receiving this email because you made a purchase at PlanetBids, which
partners with Stripe to provide invoicing and payment processing.

 

 

 

http://www.planetbids.com/
http://www.planetbids.com/
http://www.planetbids.com/
http://www.planetbids.com/
http://support.planetbids.com/support
mailto:support@planetbids.com
tel:+18189921771
https://dashboard.stripe.com/emails/receipts/rfdrc_1L1b0MLMT19CKDS4CUr5nmQb
https://stripe.com/




Invoice
Date

5/31/2022
Invoice #

13644

Bill To:
Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority
100 W California Ave
Ridgecrest, CA 93555

P.O. No. Due Date

7/15/2022

Inv Sent

6/23/2022

Total

PO Box 1350
Carmel Valley, CA 93924

Description AmountDate
Reimbursable Expenses for City of Ridegecrest Monthly
Rent  ($300) - please see attached

300.005/31/2022

$300.00



AGREEMENT FOR LEASE OF 
100 W. CALIFORNIA AVENUE, RIDGECREST, CA 

 
by and between 

 
THE CITY OF RIDGECREST AND 

REGIONAL GOVERNMENT SERVICES 
 

AGREEMENT: 
 

Premises:  For and in consideration of the terms, covenants, and conditions contained in this 
Agreement, City leases to RGS, and RGS leases from City, an approximate 210 square foot 
office space located along with the monthly use of the City’s conference room located at 100 
W. California Avenue., Ridgecrest, County of Kern, State of California, depicted on the floor 
plan attached as Exhibit “A” (“Premises”). 

 
Term: The initial term of this Agreement (“Term”) shall commence on the Execution Date 
and terminate one year (12 months) thereafter, unless sooner terminated or extended as 
provided in this Agreement. 

 
Option to Extend Term: Provided RGS is not in default of any of the terms, covenants, or 
conditions of this Agreement, RGS shall have one option to request an extension of the 
initial Term for a two-year period (“Option Term”).  RGS may exercise the option by 
giving the City’s City Manager (“CM”) written notice of RGS’s desire to extend, not less 
than 60 days prior to expiration of the initial Term.  The CM, at the CM’s sole discretion, 
may accept or reject the request to extend. 

 
 

 
4. Right to Terminate:   Either Party may terminate this Agreement for any reason by 

providing a 60-day prior written notice to the other Party. 
 
5. Hold Over:  If RGS holds over after the expiration of the Term, with the express or 

implied consent of City, such holding over shall be a tenancy only from month to month and shall be 
governed by the terms, covenants, and conditions contained in this Agreement.  
 

6. Rental Consideration:  
 

a. In General: As consideration for the lease of the Premises during the Term, RGS 
shall pay to City in lawful money of the United States, to CM at 100 W. CALIFORNIA AVENUE, 
RIDGECREST, CA, or to such persons and at such places as may be designated from time to time by 
City. The first rental payment shall be paid within 30 days of the Execution Date, and thereafter for the 
balance of the Term, shall be paid on or before the first of each month. In the event RGS occupies the 
Premises for a partial month at any time, RGS shall only be responsible for a prorated portion of the 
Rent. 

 
b. Fair Market Rental Value:  The fair market rental rate of the facility is 

determined to be $300 per month ($1.43 per square foot).   

RGSLaptop5CG732316C
Highlight





Invoice
Date

5/31/2022
Invoice #

13544

Bill To:
Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority
100 W California Ave
Ridgecrest, CA 93555

P.O. No. Due Date

6/30/2022

Inv Sent

6/15/2022

Total

PO Box 1350
Carmel Valley, CA 93924

Description AmountDate
Contract Services for May - please see attached 21,327.505/31/2022

$21,327.50



Month:  

Monthly
Advisor Reg Hrs Bill Rate Reg Hrs Bill Rate Total Billed

CT 13.00 130.00$  16.75 130.00$  3,867.50$    
AK 74.10 105.00$  67.40 105.00$  14,857.50$  
JK 0.75 137.00$  1.00 137.00$  239.75$       
GL 0.00 -$        0.00 -$        -$            
GS 12.50 137.00$  3.25 137.00$  2,157.75$    
RM 1.25 164.00$  0.00 -$        205.00$       

Totals 101.60 88.40 21,327.50$  

Indian Wells Valley

May, 2022

Hours and Rates by Pay Period
1st -15th 16th - EOM

Indian Wells 6/10/2022



Client Activity Report
May 2022

Client Task Comment Hours
Client Hours 190.00Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority
Task Hours 147.954070-000 - IWVGA General Administration

RGS staff call Email correspondence with staff Shipment of equipment Board 
meeting prep Meeting coordination Litigation support

4.005/2/2022

Review and respond to emails 0.255/2/2022
Coordinate attendance at grant ceremony; phone calls; various emails 0.755/3/2022
Email correspondence with staff Board meeting prep Call with constituent 
Document review

3.205/3/2022

GA staff meeting; research and draft grant press release 1.005/4/2022
Email correspondence with staff Board meeting prep Conference call with staff 
Document review Agenda updates Action item updates Call with staff member

7.605/4/2022

Finalize and distribute press release; various emails 1.005/5/2022
Email correspondence with staff Board meeting prep Document review Press 
release

7.505/5/2022

Review and respond to emails; general admin 0.505/6/2022
Email correspondence with staff Call with staff member Board meeting prep 5.405/6/2022
Review and edit board meeting agenda; review and edit legislative support letters 1.005/7/2022
Email correspondence with staff Board meeting prep Document review 3.205/7/2022
Email correspondence with staff Agenda distribution / posting 1.005/8/2022
GA team meeting; review and respond to email; review agenda packet 1.255/9/2022
Email correspondence with staff Board meeting prep Call with RGS staff Call with 
staff member Board packet compilation / distribution / posting Email 
correspondence with public

8.205/9/2022

Email correspondence with staff Board meeting prep Document distribution Call 
with constituent

5.805/10/2022

Attend pre-meeting, closed and open board meetings; review emails and 
correspondence

4.255/11/2022

Email correspondence with staff Board meeting prep Board Meeting Call with staff 
member Meeting coordination

8.605/11/2022

Email correspondence with staff Call with staff member Conference call 4.505/12/2022
GA debrief meeting; review and respond to emails 2.005/12/2022
Email correspondence with staff 1.005/13/2022
Review and respond to emails; review C&E info from PAC 0.755/13/2022
Review emails and correspondence 0.255/14/2022
Email correspondence with staff Agenda updates Action item updates 1.405/14/2022
GA team meeting; meeting w/DWR P. Gosselin; call re pending litigation; review 
various emails

3.005/16/2022

RGS team call email correspondence with staff Call with staff member RFP process 
Litigation support Conference call with staff

5.705/16/2022

Attend DWR facilitation meeting 1.505/17/2022
Email correspondence with staff Call with constituent 2.305/17/2022
Email correspondence with staff RFP process Call with staff member Litigation 
assistance

6.005/18/2022

Research and review info re InyoKern CSD; review various email 0.505/18/2022
Email correspondence with staff RFP process Call with staff member 4.005/19/2022
Review and respond to various emails 0.505/19/2022



Client Activity Report
May 2022

Client Task Comment Hours
Research and follow up re bid advertising; review and correspond with CCG re 
funding opportunities regarding land fallowing; follow up re DWR facilitation and 
discussion re outreach improvements

2.005/20/2022

Email correspondence with staff RFP process Call with staff members 6.005/20/2022
Email correspondence with staff RGS staff call PAC Agenda posting / distribution 
PAC Meeting prep Meeting coordination

6.305/23/2022

GA team meeting; review C&E plan info; review comments from PAC members re 
C&E plans for GA and others; review and respond to various email

1.755/23/2022

Email correspondence with staff PAC Meeting prep RFP process Litigation 
assistance Meeting coordination

5.205/24/2022

Review and respond to email 0.255/24/2022
Attend Kern Co. well permitting meeting; attend GA staff meeting; review draft 
allocation table, CCG leg info

2.505/25/2022

Email correspondence with staff Call with staff member RFP process PAC meeting 
prep Conference call with staff Agenda updates

7.805/25/2022

Legislative call w/CCG and attorney; attend PAC meeting 3.005/26/2022
Email correspondence with staff Call with constituent PAC meeting prep RFP 
process

5.005/26/2022

Review and respond to email 0.255/27/2022
Monthly Report Forms 3.005/27/2022
GA team meeting; provide written response to auditor questions; review draft 
legal documents re pending litigation

1.505/31/2022

Email correspondence with staff RGS team call Minutes RFP process 5.505/31/2022

Task Hours 42.054070-001 - IWVGA Finance
Discuss audit findings and how to report them.?? 0.505/2/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP; Meetings w/ RM; RGS Staff Meeting 4.005/2/2022
RGS staff meeting 0.755/2/2022
Payment tracker updates 2.005/2/2022
Review draft audit and tied to original working papers. Came up with questions for 
the auditors.?

0.755/3/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP; Meetings w/ RM 2.005/3/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: IWVGA Staff Meeting 0.505/4/2022
GS:RGS/IWVGA: Financials WIP 0.255/6/2022
Payment processing 1.605/6/2022
GS:RGS/IWVGA: Financials WIP 0.505/7/2022
Deposit download 1.605/9/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: RGS Staff Meeting 1.005/9/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP 0.255/10/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Board Meeting; Audit WIP 2.505/11/2022
2022 Deposit detail 3.005/12/2022
Audit WIP Invoice tracker updates Payment processing 4.505/13/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP; Financials WIP 1.505/13/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: RGS Staff Meeting 0.505/16/2022
RGS staff mtg 0.755/16/2022
Voucher Requests Invoice Tracker updates 2.305/16/2022
Voucher Requests Invoice Tracker updates 1.005/19/2022



Client Activity Report
May 2022

Client Task Comment Hours
Invoice Tracker updates 0.305/20/2022
Invoice Review Invoice Tracker updates 0.705/23/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: RGS Staff Meeting; Audit WIP; Call w/ RM 1.505/23/2022
Deposit 2.805/24/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP 0.255/24/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP; Call w/ KG 0.505/27/2022
2022 Deposit Detail Payment tracker updates 3.505/27/2022
Dept mtg 0.255/31/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: RGS Staff Meeting 0.505/31/2022





Capitol Core Group, Inc.
205 Cartwheel Bend (Operations Dept.)
Austin, TX  78738 US
512.568.3084
operations@capitolcore.com
www.capitolcore.com

BILL TO
Indian Wells Valley Groundwater 
Authority
500 West Ridgecrest Blvd.
Ridgecrest, California  93555
USA

INVOICE 2022-029

DATE 07/05/2022    TERMS Net 45

DUE DATE 08/19/2022

VENDOR ID INVOICE PERIOD
195953 June 2022

DATE ACCOUNT SUMMARY AMOUNT

06/01/2022 Balance Forward 19,187.50
Other payments and credits after 06/01/2022 through 07/04/2022 -19,187.50

07/05/2022 Other invoices from this date 0.00
New charges (details below) 14,025.00
Total Amount Due 14,025.00

ACTIVITY HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Charges
Task 1 -- Secure Imported Water Supplies
Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask A:  Quarterly internal strategy call {McKinney}

1 250.00 250.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask A:  Agency Seller-1 -- quick follow up phone call {Tatum}

0.50 250.00 125.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask A: Private Seller-2 -- Ongoing negotiations, term-sheet 
redevelopment, internal calls {Tatum}

7 250.00 1,750.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask A:  Contractor-to-Contractor discussion financing {Tatum}

1.50 250.00 375.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask B:  Interconnection strategy (internal discussion) {Tatum}

2 250.00 500.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask D: 2022 Water Year -- Agency Discussions and Call {Tatum}

1 250.00 250.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask A:  Ongoing Negotiation, Term Sheet Redevelopment, Internal Calls 
-- Private Seller 2 {Simonetti}

7.25 225.00 1,631.25

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask A:  Contractor-to-Contractor meeting re: financing

1.25 225.00 281.25

Invoice Total Task 1: $5,162.50 (21.5 hours)
Task 2 -- Secure Federal Funding Sources



ACTIVITY HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Government Relations:Federal
Congressional:  Water Resources Development Act of 2022 -- direct 
Advocacy House, Transportation & Infrastructure Committee staff, Senator 
Padilla briefing {McKinney}

2.50 250.00 625.00

Government Relations:Federal
Congressional:  Energy & Water Development Act for FY2023 -- Army 
Corps of Engineerings Fund, analysis, House Committee on Appropriations 
{McKinney}

1.50 250.00 375.00

Government Relations:Federal
Congressional:  FY2023 NDAA -- DCIP language House/Senate analysis 
{McKinney}

1.50 250.00 375.00

Government Relations:Federal
Congressional:  FY2023 NDAA -- DCIP Amendments:  Direct Advocacy, 
mtgs w/ Reps Escobar and Gonzalez, HASC and SASC, full Committee 
markup House {Simonetti}

5.75 225.00 1,293.75

Government Relations:Federal
Congressional:  WRDA-22 directive language:  Follow-up w/ Rep. 
McCarthy, House Transportation & Infrastructure Committee markup, 
follow-up with House E&WD Subcommittee on appropriations {Simonetti}

5.25 225.00 1,181.25

Invoice Total Task 2: $3,510.00 (16.5 hours)
Task 3 -- Secure State Funding Sources
Government Relations:California
Legislative:  Direct Advocacy State Budget (Senate Amendment/Governor's 
May Revision/Assembly) -- Assembly/Senate Budget Committee and 
Leadership {McKinney}

2 250.00 500.00

Government Relations:California
Legislative:  State Budget Deal Analysis and Lobbying (Split) {McKinney}

2 250.00 500.00

Government Relations:California
Legislative:  Wastewater Treatment Plant State Budget Request 
Assembly/Senate -- final lobbying {McKinney}

7.50 250.00 1,875.00

Government Relations:California
Legislative: Wastewater Treatment Plant -- direct advocacy Assembly/Senate 
{Simonetti}

4.50 225.00 1,012.50

Invoice Total Task 3: $3,887.50 (16 hours)
Task 4 -- Administrative
Administrative
Board Meeting:  Board Meeting and Materials Preparation {Simonetti}

4 225.00 900.00

Administrative
Reporting:  Materials preparation water costs {Simonetti}

1 225.00 225.00

Invoice Total Task 4: $1,125.00 (5 hours)
-----------------------------------
Compliance Reporting for Invoice:
Invoice:  Federal Reporting, WWTP = $1,668.75
Invoice: Federal Reporting, IWVGA = $1,841.25
Invoice:  State Reporting, WWTP = $2,887.50
Invoice:  State Reporting IWVGA = $1,000.00
----------------------------------
Compliance Reporting Quarterly:



ACTIVITY HOURS RATE AMOUNT

2nd Qtr 2022: Federal Reporting WWTP = $4,181.25
2nd Qtr. 2022:  Federal Reporting IWVGA = $5,185.500
2nd Qtr 2022: State Reporting WWTP = $8,568.75
2nd Qtr 2022: State Reporting IWVGA = $9,746.25
NOTE: 2nd Quarter 2022 Disclosure Reports to the California Secretary of 
State are due by July 21, 2022
-------------------------------------

Thank you for your business.  Please make checks payable to 
Capitol Core Group, Inc.

TOTAL OF NEW 
CHARGES 14,025.00

TOTAL DUE $14,025.00





 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
July 8, 2022 
 
Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority 
Attn: Carol Thomas-Keefer 
500 W. Ridgecrest Blvd 
Ridgecrest, CA 93555 
 
Dear Carol: 
 
Provided is our report and invoice for May 1, 2022 – June 30, 2022. This information pertains to the Task #6 of 
Addendum No. 1 for Agreement 03-19. Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions, comments, or 
concerns; my contact information is listed below.  
 
The packet includes the following: 

 Invoice & Details 
 Timesheets 
 Expense Forms 
 Equipment Expenses 

 
Sincerely, 

 
 
 

Dustin Hardwick 
Deputy Director 
California Rural Water Association 
1234 N. Market Boulevard 
Sacramento, CA 95834 
Phone: (760) 920-0842 
Email: dhardwick@calruralwater.org 
 



 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

I. Invoice & Detail Cost  



May-June 2022

To: Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority Invoice #: IWVGA-Task#6-003
Attn: Carol Thomas-Keefer Invoice Date: 7/8/2022
500 W. Ridgecrest Blvd Terms: Net 30 Days
Ridgecrest CA, 93555

Pay: California Rural Water Association
1234 North Market Blvd.
Sacramento, CA 95834

Project Name: IWVGA Task #6 Agreement 03-19 Addendum No. 1

Work Plan/AR # Description of work Date Cost
Admin and project support Invoice period 1,251.00$                       
Technician Admin suport Invoice period 5,937.50$                       
Technician Travel Hours Invoice period 1,192.50$                       

Cost
118.76$                          

44.46$                            
342.99$                          

Cost
132.50$                          

9,019.71$                       

Submitted by:
Dustin Hardwick, Deputy Director Signature
California Rural Water Association

7/8/2022
Date

FCS equip repair and upkeep (Ground mic)

Task 6

IWVGA-Searles Valley Water District

California Rural Water Association
Task #6 Additional Conservation and Drought Mngmt Planning

INVOICE

INVOICE TOTAL:

Milage, Meals, Lodging
Milage, Meals, Lodging
Milage, Meals, LodgingMichael Sims

Abel Silva
Mark Hardison

Travel Expenditures
Name

Task 6

Description of Travel

Task 6

Name Description of Equipment
Equipment



Invoice # Amount
IWVGA-Task#6-001 $20,653.50
IWVGA-Task#6-002 $19,615.13
IWVGA-Task#6-003 $9,019.71

Total $49,288.34

Expenditure Tracking



Date of Invoice or Receipt Description Rate Hours
Amount this Invoice 
for PM and Admin

A. Personnel Name of Employee
For All Dates within Invoice Period Dustin Hardwick $75 7  $    525.00 
For All Dates within Invoice Period Jacob DeLuna $33 22  $    726.00 
For All Dates within Invoice Period
For All Dates within Invoice Period
For All Dates within Invoice Period

A. Subtotal = 29.00  $    1,251.00 
C. Equipment Description of Equipment

B. Subtotal =  $    -  
C. Travel Expenitures Description of Expendatures

C. Subtotal = -$   
D. Travel Hours Description of Travel (when, where, why, who, type of expense, etc.)

-$   
-$   
-$   

D. Subtotal = 0 -$   
E. Professional and Consultant Services Name of Consultant 

E. Subtotal = 1,251.00$    

Revised 8/16/16

IWVGA-Task #6
Invoice Detail
***** Below should reflect all direct Admin Costs (costs  tied to Task #6) from May to June 2022:



Date of Invoice or Receipt Description Rate Hours
Amount this Invoice 
for PM and Admin

A. Personnel Name of Employee
For All Dates within Invoice Period Michael Sims $115 48.5  $    5,577.50 
For All Dates within Invoice Period Abel Silva $90 2  $    180.00 
For All Dates within Invoice Period Mark Hardison $90 2  $    180.00 
For All Dates within Invoice Period
For All Dates within Invoice Period
For All Dates within Invoice Period
For All Dates within Invoice Period

A. Subtotal = 52.50  $    5,937.50 
C. Equipment Description of Equipment
Ground mic Repair and maintenance $132.50

B. Subtotal = $132.50 

Michael Sims Milage, Lodging, meals 118.76$    
Abel Silva Milage, Lodging, meals 44.46$    
Mark Hardison Milage, Lodging, meals 342.99$    

C. Subtotal = 506.21$    
D. Travel Hours Description of Travel (when, where, why, who, type of expense, etc.)
Michael Sims Travel to Zenner HQ for tour and meter inspection $115 4.5 517.50$    
Abel Silva Travel to Zenner HQ for tour and meter inspection $90 2 180.00$    
Mark Hardison Travel to Zenner HQ for tour and meter inspection $90 5.5 495.00$    

D. Subtotal = 12 1,192.50$    
E. Professional and Consultant Services Name of Consultant 

E. Subtotal = 7,768.71$    

Revised 8/16/16

IWVGA-Task #6
Invoice Detail
***** Below should reflect all direct Technician Costs (costs  tied to Task #6) from May to June 2022: 



 
 

 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

II. Timesheets  



First Name Last Name Job Code Date hours notes
Michael Sims Admin 5/2/2022 1 Admin
Michael Sims Admin 5/2/2022 1 Admin-meter change out, working with Gene at iFlow

Michael Sims Admin 5/3/2022 1 Admin-meter change out, working with Gene at iFlow

Michael Sims Admin 5/6/2022 1 Admin-meter change out, working with Gene at iFlow

Michael Sims Admin 5/6/2022 1 Admin

Michael Sims Admin 5/9/2022 1 Working with Gene iflow on meter quote revision
Michael Sims Admin 5/16/2022 2 Calling system for more meter information
Michael Sims Admin 5/17/2022 3 Calling system for more meter information and training

Michael Sims Admin 5/18/2022 2 Calling system for more meter information and training

Michael Sims Admin 5/19/2022 2 Calling system for more meter information and training

Michael Sims Admin 5/20/2022 1 Prepared and sent Jacob meter quotes

Michael Sims Admin 5/23/2022 1.5  Geƫng more informaƟon from iFlow on meters.Working with Jacob on meter quotes

Michael Sims Admin 5/23/2022 1.5 Trying to contact Mike Pierce for meter information

Michael Sims Admin 5/24/2022 1 Admin

Michael Sims Admin 5/27/2022 1 Prepping tour with Gene at Zenner with team

Michael Sims Admin 5/27/2022 2 Admin

Michael Sims Admin 5/31/2022 2  AdminGeƫng more informaƟon from iFlow on meters.

Michael Sims Admin 6/1/2022 1 Gathering information

Michael Sims Admin 6/2/2022 1.5 Admin prepping for workshop and meter change out

Michael Sims Admin 6/3/2022 0.5 Admin with systems information

Michael Sims Admin 6/3/2022 1.5 Admin prepping for workshop and meter change out with Gene

Michael Sims Admin 6/6/2022 1 Admin

Michael Sims Admin 6/6/2022 1 Phone call with Jacob, discussing questions from Stetson Engineering and working with Gene at iFlow

Michael Sims Admin 6/7/2022 1 Discussing with Gene the comments from Carol from IWVGA

Michael Sims Admin 6/7/2022 1 Admin

Michael Sims Admin 6/8/2022 1 Discussing with Gene the comments from Stetson and IWVGA

Michael Sims Admin 6/9/2022 1 Admin

Michael Sims Admin 6/9/2022 2 IWVGA Meter Model Specs conference call

Michael Sims Admin 6/10/2022 1 Admin

Michael Sims Admin 6/10/2022 2 Email and phone calls with Jacob, Gene in providing a new quote with brass bottoms

Michael Sims Admin 6/13/2022 1 Gene's next quote for metal body meters, waiting

Michael Sims Admin 6/13/2022 1 Prep and email systems for onsite workshop training in July

Michael Sims Admin 6/20/2022 1 Admin- emailing systems on workshops

Michael Sims Travel 6/21/2022 4.5 Travel to Zenner factory

Michael Sims Admin 6/21/2022 2 Zenner Factory tour

Michael Sims Admin 6/22/2022 1 Admin-responding back to emails

Michael Sims Admin 6/23/2022 2 Admin

Total Travel: 4.5 Total Personel: 48.5

First Name Last Name Job Code Date hours Admin-catch up call with Jacob
Abel Silva Travel 6/21/2022 2 Travel to Zenner Site
Abel Silva Admin 6/21/2022 2 Zenner Meter Tour
Total Travel: 2 Total Personel: 2

First Name Last Name Job Code Date hours notes
Mark Hardison Travel 6/20/2022 2.75 Travel from Home Office in Tehachapi to IHG Hotel in Banning for Facility Tour at Zenner Meter scheduled for 6/21/22.
Mark Hardison Admin 6/21/2022 2 Attend Facility Tour at Zenner Meter.
Mark Hardison Travel 6/21/2022 2.75 Travel back to Home Office in Tehachapi after attending Facility Tour at Zenner Meter. 
Total Travel: 5.5 Total Personel: 2

First Name Last Name Job Code Date hours notes
Jacob DeLuna Admin 5/2/2022 1.5 Expense report input for technicians
Jacob DeLuna Admin 5/3/2022 1 Admin support, Invoicing
Jacob DeLuna Admin 5/4/2022 2.25 Notice to proceed Task #6, invoicing and admin support
Jacob DeLuna Admin 5/6/2022 0.75 Admin Support
Jacob DeLuna Admin 5/17/2022 1.25 Invoice submission to Joseph M.
Jacob DeLuna Admin 5/18/2022 1.25 Equipment invoicing, Task #6 follow up
Jacob DeLuna Admin 5/19/2022 1.5 Task #6 meter replacement quote follow up, Invoice correction
Jacob DeLuna Admin 5/20/2022 1.75 Invoice corrections
Jacob DeLuna Admin 5/23/2022 0.75 Meter quote follow up
Jacob DeLuna Admin 6/6/2022 2.25 Program update call with Michael S., meter inquiry response to Joseph



Jacob DeLuna Admin 6/7/2022 0.5 Call scheduling with Joseph 
Jacob DeLuna Admin 6/8/2022 0.25 Conference call availability to Joseph
Jacob DeLuna Admin 6/9/2022 1.75 Meter Model Specs inquiry/meeting discussion, reply to email inquiry
Jacob DeLuna Admin 6/10/2022 0.75 Admin support
Jacob DeLuna Admin 6/14/2022 1 meter quote inquiry, brass meter quote
Jacob DeLuna Admin 6/16/2022 0.75 Admin Support
Jacob DeLuna Admin 6/22/2022 0.25 Admin support
Jacob DeLuna Admin 6/27/2022 1.25 Admin support, technician inquiry
Jacob DeLuna Admin 6/29/2022 0.5 Admin support, meter follow up
Jacob DeLuna Admin 6/30/2022 0.75 Response to Stetson inquiry, admin support
Total Travel: 0 Total Personel: 22

First Name Last Name Job Code Date hours notes
Dustin Hardwick Admin 5/12/2022 1 Project Support
Dustin Hardwick Admin 5/19/2022 1 Project Support
Dustin Hardwick Admin 5/24/2022 1 Project Support
Dustin Hardwick Admin 6/7/2022 1 Project Support
Dustin Hardwick Admin 6/8/2022 1 Project Support
Dustin Hardwick Admin 6/9/2022 1 Project Support
Dustin Hardwick Admin 6/30/2022 1 Project Support
Total Travel: 0 Total Personel: 7



III. Travel Expenses



Program: IWVGA Period: June 2022

Name:
Address to mail check:
City / State / Zip:

Purpose of trip(s):

Total # of Quarters (From Details Sheet):

0 X 14.75 0.00
0 X 16.00 0.00
0 X 17.25 0.00
0 X 18.50 0.00
0 X 19.75 0.00

Total Per Diem >> $0.00

Total Mileage: 203  X  $0.585 per mile
Total Mileage >> $118.76

Lodging 0.00
Phone 0.00
Air Fare 0.00
Rental Car / Taxi 0.00
Rental Car / Taxi 0.00
Postage 0.00
Supplies 0.00
Other 0.00

$0.00

$118.76

Employee Signature: Date:

Approval Signature: Date:

(From Details Sheet)

Total Personal Out-Of-Pocket Miscellaneous  >>

Total Amount of Reimbursement:  =

Miscellaneous Expenses

Personal Vehicle Mileage

2022 TRAVEL EXPENSE REPORT

California Rural Water Association
1234 N. Market St.

Sacramento, CA 95834

 Per Diem Calculation

Michael Sims
12842 Casa Ct.
Poway, CA 92064

IWVGA meter replacement task (Zenner site visit)



DATE AMOUNT
DATE $14.75 $16.00 $17.25 $18.50 $19.75 HIGH COST CITY OR COUNTY

TOTALS 0 0 0 0 0

DATE REASON
6/21/22 To banning for Zenner visit
6/21/22 to Home

203

Expense Details

Car Rental / Taxi

Air Fare

Phone/Wifi

Lodging
Per Diem Detail (Quarters)

101
TOTALFINISH

101
102102

START
0
0

Total Mileage:

Mileage Detail
Car Rental / Taxi

Postage

Supplies

Other





























IV. Equipment Expenses



INVOICE

Fluid Conservation Systems, Inc.
502 TechneCenter Dr.

Suite B
Milford, OH 45150

Fed ID No. 74-2619979
Phone (513) 831-9335

Fax (513) 831-9336

Invoice Address:

CALIFORNIA RURAL WATER ASSOCIATION
1234 NORTH MARKET BOULEVARD
SACRAMENTO, CA 95834

CALIFORNIA RURAL WATER ASSOCIATION
20860 La Barranca Ave. 
Tehachapi, CA 93561
Mhardison@calruralwater.org
msims@calruralwater.or

Delivery Address:

Purchase Order Ref. Invoice  No.DateTypeF.O.B.Our Ref.Account
VERBAL IWVGA 12136 ORIGIN INV Page: 1 05/18/2022 11431

Description Net $Price $Quantity * 

CRWA

RMA 10012502 #2823 0.00 00.00

DXMIC 00735 0.00 00.00

REPAIR LABOR 1.50 225.00 0150.00
-REPAIRED FUSE ON BOARD
-FULLY CHARGED TESTED SYSTEM

FREIGHT 1.00 40.00 140.00

Due By 06/17/2022

Total $ 265.00

Sales TAX $ 0.00

Net $FOB ORIGIN 265.00

All business is subject to our Terms & Conditions which can be found at:- http://www.fluidconservation.com/terms.htm
A Halma Group Company

50% Prop 1 Leak/ 50% other program
265/2 = $132.50

IWVGA Total: $132.50

ncook
Highlight





 Brown Armstrong Accountancy Corporation
4200 Truxtun Avenue

Suite 300
Bakersfield, CA  93309

661-324-4971

INDIAN WELLS VALLEY GROUNDWATER AUTHORITY  Invoice No. 264894

100 W. CALIFORNIA AVENUE

RIDGECREST, CA  93555 Date Sunday, May 29, 2022

 Client No. 32711.001

                                                                                                                                                                            

Final billing on 2020 audit:

(Contract amount/Billed to date: $12,000/$12,000)

 Current Invoice Amount $        5,000.00

 Beginning Balance         6,000.00

 Balance Due $      11,000.00

 0 - 30 31- 60  61 - 90 91 - 120 Over 120 Balance
 5,000.00 5,000.00 1,000.00 0.00 0.00 11,000.00

Please remit by: June 25, 2022
Credit Card and ACH Payments Accepted on BA Payment Portal, Bacpas.com

Click on "Make a Payment"
(3.5% Convenience Fee will Apply on Credit Cards)

Make checks payable to:  Brown Armstrong
E-mail billing inquiries to: Katrina Soto

 ksoto@bacpas.com





IWVGA

FY 2022
REPAYMENT SCHEDULE FOR KERN COUNTY OBLIGATION

OUTSTANDING OBLIGATION  500,000$                

YEAR TO DATE PAYMENTS (125,000)                 

REMAINING PAYMENTS 375,000$                

PAYMENTS
MONTH PAYMENT MARCH  JULY SEPT DEC TOTAL

March Payment 1 125,000$            ‐                       ‐                       ‐                         125,000$                
TOTAL 125,000$            ‐                       ‐                       ‐                         125,000$                

REMAINING PAYMENTS
MONTH PAYMENT MARCH  JULY SEPT DEC TOTAL

March Payment 1 ‐$                     ‐                       ‐                       ‐                         ‐$                         
July Payment 2 ‐                       125,000              ‐                       ‐                         125,000                   
Sept Payment 3 ‐                       ‐                       125,000              ‐                         125,000                   
Dec Payment 4 ‐                       ‐                       ‐                       125,000                125,000                   

TOTAL ‐$                     125,000              125,000              125,000                375,000$                
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