
Itemized Invoice Packet 
Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority 

Regular Board Meeting 
December 14, 2022 





City of Ridgecrest
Attn: Alan Christensen
100 W. California Ave.
Ridgecrest, CA 93555

Professional Services through 10/31/2022

Project #: 2652 Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority

2652-63

12/01/22

Invoice Number:

Invoice Date:

Invoice

Water Resources Management 2022
01 - Meetings & Prep

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $4,621.5019.50 $237.00
Supervisor I $3,965.5019.25 $206.00
Senior Associate $1,440.0011.25 $128.00
Associate III $444.004.00 $111.00
Assistant I $4,263.0043.50 $98.00

$14,734.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$14,734.00Meetings & Prep Subtotal:
02 - Prop 1 / Prop 68 Grant Administration

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $103.000.50 $206.00
Senior Associate $1,024.008.00 $128.00
Associate III $83.250.75 $111.00
Assistant I $2,131.5021.75 $98.00

$3,341.75Professional Services Subtotal:

$3,341.75Prop 1 / Prop 68 Grant Administration Subtotal:
02.01 - SGMA IP Grant Administration

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $154.500.75 $206.00
Senior Associate $576.004.50 $128.00
Assistant I $294.003.00 $98.00

$1,024.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$1,024.50SGMA IP Grant Administration Subtotal:
03 - Grant Review & Application Preparation

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $1,303.505.50 $237.00
Supervisor I $2,420.5011.75 $206.00
Supervisor II $2,292.0012.00 $191.00
Senior Associate $1,280.0010.00 $128.00
GIS Manager $61.000.50 $122.00
GIS Specialist I $101.001.00 $101.00
Assistant I $392.004.00 $98.00

$7,850.00Professional Services Subtotal:
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$7,850.00Grant Review & Application Preparation Subtotal:
04 - Data Mgmt System Support

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $355.501.50 $237.00
Associate I $396.503.25 $122.00

$752.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$752.00Data Mgmt System Support Subtotal:
05 - General Project Mgmt

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $237.001.00 $237.00
Supervisor I $1,751.008.50 $206.00
Senior Associate $576.004.50 $128.00
Assistant I $220.502.25 $98.00

$2,784.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$2,784.50General Project Mgmt Subtotal:
06 - Model Transfer & Upgrade

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $8,755.0042.50 $206.00
Supervisor II $6,923.7536.25 $191.00
Associate I $945.507.75 $122.00
GIS Manager $2,623.0021.50 $122.00

$19,247.25Professional Services Subtotal:
Reimbursables Charge

Car Rental $236.88
Field Supplies $34.30
Lodging $1,041.34
Meals $276.46
Mileage $683.76
Other Expenses $2.43
Reproduction $9.36

$2,284.53Reimbursables Subtotal:
Sub-Contractors Charge

Board of Regents $23,666.17
$23,666.17Sub-Contractors Subtotal:

$45,197.95Model Transfer & Upgrade Subtotal:
07.01 - 01 Imported Water: Planning/Design/Environmental

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $4,977.0021.00 $237.00
Supervisor I $4,892.5023.75 $206.00
Assistant I $8,036.0082.00 $98.00

$17,905.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$17,905.5001 Imported Water: Planning/Design/Environmental Subtotal:
09 - Recycled Water

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $829.503.50 $237.00
Supervisor I $1,133.005.50 $206.00
Supervisor II $11,078.0058.00 $191.00
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09 - Recycled Water
Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

GIS Manager $91.500.75 $122.00
Associate II $377.003.25 $116.00
Assistant I $1,470.0015.00 $98.00

$14,979.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$14,979.00Recycled Water Subtotal:
11 - Data Collection, Monitoring & Data Gaps

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $1,802.508.75 $206.00
Supervisor II $4,966.0026.00 $191.00
Senior II $1,192.008.00 $149.00
Associate I $7,015.0057.50 $122.00
GIS Manager $91.500.75 $122.00
Associate III $111.001.00 $111.00
Senior Assistant $6,514.7563.25 $103.00

$21,692.75Professional Services Subtotal:
Reimbursables Charge

Car Rental $1,759.25
Field Supplies $328.40
Lodging $1,113.45
Meals $179.23
Overnight Mail $280.98
Toll $7.00

$3,668.31Reimbursables Subtotal:
Sub-Contractors Charge

Horizon Environmental, Inc. $8,751.95
$8,751.95Sub-Contractors Subtotal:

$34,113.01Data Collection, Monitoring & Data Gaps Subtotal:
12 - Prop 1 SDAC Program Support

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $566.502.75 $206.00
Assistant I $2,058.0021.00 $98.00

$2,624.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$2,624.50Prop 1 SDAC Program Support Subtotal:
17 - Navy/Coso Royalty Fund: Develop FY23 Projects & Secure Funding

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $1,659.007.00 $237.00
Supervisor I $1,648.008.00 $206.00

$3,307.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$3,307.00Navy/Coso Royalty Fund: Develop FY23 Projects & Secure Funding Subtotal:
18 - Navy/Coso Royalty Fund: FY21 Rose Valley MW Permitting, Bid Doc Support & Dr

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $474.002.00 $237.00
Supervisor I $206.001.00 $206.00
Supervisor II $95.500.50 $191.00

$775.50Professional Services Subtotal:
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$775.50Navy/Coso Royalty Fund: FY21 Rose Valley MW Permitting, Bid Doc Support & Dr
20 - Shallow Well Mitigation Program: Outreach & Impacts Evaluation

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $2,607.0011.00 $237.00
Supervisor I $875.504.25 $206.00
Assistant I $2,719.5027.75 $98.00

$6,202.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$6,202.00Shallow Well Mitigation Program: Outreach & Impacts Evaluation Subtotal:
21 - General Engineering

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $1,066.504.50 $237.00
Supervisor I $206.001.00 $206.00

$1,272.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$1,272.50General Engineering Subtotal:
23 - Annual Report Preparation

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $237.001.00 $237.00
Supervisor I $515.002.50 $206.00
Supervisor II $5,491.2528.75 $191.00
Senior Associate $1,024.008.00 $128.00

$7,267.25Professional Services Subtotal:

$7,267.25Annual Report Preparation Subtotal:
26 - Budget Support

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $257.501.25 $206.00
Senior Associate $224.001.75 $128.00
Associate III $111.001.00 $111.00

$592.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$592.50Budget Support Subtotal:
27 - Litigation Support

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $1,540.506.50 $237.00
Supervisor I $5,716.5027.75 $206.00
Senior Associate $960.007.50 $128.00
Associate III $666.006.00 $111.00
Assistant I $220.502.25 $98.00

$9,103.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$9,103.50Litigation Support Subtotal:

Water Resources Management 2022 Subtotal: $173,826.96

$173,826.96*** Invoice Total ***



Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority

2652-63

12/01/22
Invoice Number:

Invoice Date:

REIMBURSABLE SUMMARY

10 1

06 - Model Transfer & Upgrade
Reimbursables
Description Date Units Unit Rate Charge Notes

Lodging 10/03/2022  1.00 $472.02$472.02

Meals 10/03/2022  1.00 $32.05$32.05

Mileage 10/03/2022  160.00 $100.00$0.63

Field Supplies 10/04/2022  1.00 $34.30$34.30

Meals 10/04/2022  1.00 $52.27$52.27

Mileage 10/04/2022  5.00 $3.13$0.63

Meals 10/05/2022  1.00 $21.24$21.24

Meals 10/05/2022  1.00 $50.02$50.02

Mileage 10/05/2022  5.00 $3.13$0.63

Lodging 10/06/2022  1.00 $133.74$133.74

Meals 10/06/2022  1.00 $40.72$40.72

Mileage 10/06/2022  220.00 $137.50$0.63

Mileage 10/06/2022  348.00 $217.50$0.63

Other Expenses 10/06/2022  1.00 $2.43 Scanning$2.43

Reproduction 10/06/2022  1.00 $9.36$9.36

Lodging 10/19/2022  1.00 $179.98$179.98

Meals 10/19/2022  1.00 $38.04$38.04

Meals 10/19/2022  1.00 $16.80$16.80

Mileage 10/19/2022  182.00 $113.75$0.63

Car Rental 10/20/2022  1.00 $40.00$40.00

Car Rental 10/20/2022  1.00 $54.10$54.10

Car Rental 10/20/2022  1.00 $142.78$142.78

Lodging 10/20/2022  1.00 $144.32$144.32

Lodging 10/20/2022  1.00 $111.28$111.28

Meals 10/20/2022  1.00 $11.32$11.32

Meals 10/20/2022  1.00 $14.00$14.00

Mileage 10/20/2022  174.00 $108.75$0.63

Date Units Unit Rate Charge Notes

Sub-Contractors
Description

Board of Regents 10/31/2022  1.00 $23,666.17$23,666.17

$25,950.70Model Transfer & Upgrade Sub-Total:



Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority

2652-63

12/01/22
Invoice Number:

Invoice Date:

REIMBURSABLE SUMMARY

10 1
11 - Data Collection, Monitoring & Data Gaps

Reimbursables
Description Date Units Unit Rate

Car Rental 10/02/2022  1.00

Charge Notes

$107.47$107.47

Field Supplies 10/02/2022  1.00 $77.67

Lodging 10/02/2022  1.00

$77.67

$616.52$616.52

Meals 10/02/2022  1.00 $10.28$10.28

Meals 10/02/2022  1.00 $24.99$24.99

Meals 10/02/2022  1.00 $36.32$36.32

Meals 10/02/2022  1.00 $6.45$6.45

Car Rental 10/03/2022  1.00 $74.21 Rental Car Gas$74.21

Field Supplies 10/03/2022  1.00 $51.83$51.83

Field Supplies 10/03/2022  1.00 $30.22 desiccant for sensor maintenance$30.22

Field Supplies 10/03/2022  1.00 $71.25$71.25

Field Supplies 10/03/2022  1.00 $5.80$5.80

Meals 10/03/2022  1.00 $17.28$17.28

Meals 10/03/2022  1.00 $12.64

Overnight Mail 10/03/2022  1.00 $105.49

Car Rental 10/04/2022  1.00 $73.11

Car Rental 10/04/2022  1.00

$12.64 Dinner

$105.49

$73.11 Rental Car Gas

$101.48$101.48

Field Supplies 10/04/2022  1.00 $10.70

Field Supplies 10/04/2022  1.00 $50.75

Meals 10/04/2022  1.00

$10.70

$50.75

$12.67 Dinner$12.67

Meals 10/04/2022  1.00 $9.48

Overnight Mail 10/04/2022  1.00 $175.49

Car Rental 10/05/2022  1.00 $54.14

Car Rental 10/05/2022  1.00 $76.43

Car Rental 10/05/2022  1.00 $334.48

Field Supplies 10/05/2022  1.00 $6.42

Field Supplies 10/05/2022  1.00 $12.31

Lodging 10/05/2022  1.00

$9.48 lunch

$175.49

$54.14 Rental Car Gas

$76.43 Rental Car Gas

$334.48 Rental car for IWV

$6.42

$12.31

$496.93 Ridgecrest Lodging$496.93

Meals 10/05/2022  1.00 $13.25

Meals 10/05/2022  1.00

$13.25 Lunch

$17.52$17.52

Toll 10/05/2022  1.00 $7.00 Richmond Bridge Toll - returning from IWVGA 

fieldwork

$7.00

Car Rental 10/06/2022  1.00 $95.99$95.99

Field Supplies 10/06/2022  1.00 $11.45$11.45

Meals 10/06/2022  1.00 $9.65$9.65

Meals 10/06/2022  1.00 $8.70$8.70

10/07/2022  1.00 $790.97$790.97

10/07/2022  1.00 $50.97$50.97

Date Units Unit Rate Charge Notes

Car Rental

Car Rental

Sub-Contractors
Description

Horizon Environmental, Inc. 10/31/2022  1.00 $8,751.95$8,751.95

$12,420.26Data Collection, Monitoring & Data Gaps Sub-Total:
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SPRINGHILL SUITES BY MARRIOTT® / RIDGECREST
113 East Sydnor Avenue, Ridgecrest, Ca 93555 P 760.446.1630

 springhillsuites.com 

J. Barnard
 
 
 
 

Room: 203
 
Room Type: KSTE
 
Number of Guests: 1
 
Rate: $224.00 Clerk:

 
Arrive: 03Oct22 Time: 08:01PM Depart: 05Oct22 Time: 01:00PM Folio Number: 80058

DATE DESCRIPTION CHARGES CREDITS

Operated under license from Marriott International, Inc. or one of its affiliates.

To plan your next stay, visit springhillsuites.com.

03Oct22 Room Charge 215.00
03Oct22 City Tax 21.50
03Oct22 Calif/Local Tourism Fee 0.42
03Oct22 Convention and Tourism Tax 6.45
04Oct22 Room Charge 224.00
04Oct22 City Tax 22.40
04Oct22 Calif/Local Tourism Fee 0.44
04Oct22 Convention and Tourism Tax 6.72
05Oct22 Visa 496.93
          Card #: VIXXXXXXXXXXXX2987/XXXX           
          Amount:   496.93  Auth: 03084C           
          This card was electronically swiped on 03Oct22           

BALANCE: 0.00

As a Marriott Bonvoy Member, you could have earned points towards your free dream vacation today. Start earning points and Elite
status, plus enjoy exclusive member offers. Enroll today at the front desk.

See our "Privacy & Cookie Statement" on Marriott.com.



Rental Agreement # 7R1CST

 
 
Renter Information

Renter Name

JOEL BARNARD

Renter Address

SAN RAFAEL, CA 94903

USA

 
Vehicle Information

TRAX

License #: CMH4633

State/Province: AZ

Unit #: 7T5K7F

Vehicle #: MB322085

Vehicle Class Driven

Compact SUV AWD 4 door/Automatic/

Air

Vehicle Class Charged

Compact SUV AWD 4 door/Automatic/

Air

Odometer Mileage/Kilometers

Starting: 36649 Ending: 37721

Total: 1,072

Fuel

Starting: 11.9g Ending: 13.2g

 
Thank you for renting
with Enterprise Rent-A-
Car
We appreciate your business!

This email was automatically generated

from an unattended mailbox, so please

do not reply to this e-mail.

If you have any questions about your

rental, please view our Frequently

Trip Information

Pickup
 Monday, October 3, 2022   12:10 PM

SAN RAFAEL-EAST

65 MEDWAY RD

SAN RAFAEL, CA 94901-4027

USA

Return

 Wednesday, October 5,
2022

 4:36 PM

SAN RAFAEL-EAST

65 MEDWAY RD

SAN RAFAEL, CA 94901-4027

USA

 
Renter Charges

Rental Rate Time & Distance 3 Day at $100.69 / Day $302.07

Mileage Unlimited Mileage Included

Taxes and Fees Vehicle License Recovery Fee ($1.49 / Day) $4.47

Sales Tax (9.25%) $27.94

Total $334.48

(Subject to audit)

Amount charged on October 5, 2022 to VISA (2987) ($334.48)

APN: 4341504954414C204F4E452056495341

AID: A0000000031010

Verified: Signature

Entry: Chip

TSI: F800

Amount Due $0.00





















Rewards Program ID:
You were checked out by:

You were checked in by:
Total Balance Due:

GP-JMM7186
rbrito
gsando
$0.00

EconoLodge Inn & Suites (CA294)

Ridgecrest, CA 93555
201 Inyo-Kern Rd.

gm.CA294@choicehotels.com
(760) 446-2551

Account:
Date:

Room:
Arrival Date:

Departure Date:
Check In Time:

Check Out Time: 10/20/22 6:00 AM
10/19/22 4:27 PM
10/20/22
10/19/22
170        SSC

11/1/22
839667354

3020 Bridgeway 405
Sausalito, CA 94965

Moran, Jean

Post Date Description Comment Amount
10/19/22 Visa Payment ($111.28)

XXXXXXXXXXXX8568
10/19/22 Room Charge #170 Moran, Jean $98.48
10/19/22 Occupancy Tax $9.85
10/19/22 Tourism Levy $2.95

Folio Summary 10/19/22 - 10/19/22

Room Charge $98.48
Occupancy Tax $9.85
Tourism Levy $2.95
Visa Payment ($111.28)

Balance Due: $0.00

Thank you for your business! Book your next reservation on www.choicehotels.com for the best internet rates guaranteed.

Congratulations, you are earning Choice Privileges Points for this stay! Log on to 
www.choicehotels.com/choice-privileges to redeem for free nights and other great 
rewards.

x_______________________________________________________

 If payment by credit card, I agree to pay the above total charge amount 
according to the card issuer agreement.

This rate is eligible for partner rewards. If this 
rate is changed, you may no longer be entitled 
to Choice Privileges points.





Holiday Inn West Covina
3223 East Garvey Avenue North 

West Covina, CA 91791
Telephone: (626) 966-8311 Fax: (626) 339-2850

Owned by Great Wall International, LLC and Operated by Arion Hospitality Group, LLC

10-21-22

DescriptionDate Charges Credits

*Accommodation

Occupancy Tax

CA Tourism Fee

Visa

10-20-22

10-20-22

10-20-22

10-21-22

131.00

13.10

0.22

144.32

Total 144.32 144.32

Balance 0.00

Thank you for staying with us!  Qualifying points for this stay will automatically be credited to
your account.  Please tell us about your stay by writing a review here - www.ihg.com/reviews.
 We look forward to welcoming you back soon.

XXXXXXXXXXXX3290

Jeanmarie Moran
3020 Bridegeway 405
Sausalito CA 94965
United States

10-20-22Arrival
10-21-22Departure

Folio No. Room No. 411
A/R Number

Company Conf. No.

:

:
Group Code

:
:
:

:
:
:

Rate Code : IDARP
43474008

Guest Signature:
I have received the goods and / or services in the amount shown hereon. I agree that my liablity for this bill is not waived and agree to be 
held personally liable in the event that the indicated person, company, or associate fails to pay for any part or the full amount of these 
charges. If a credit card charge, I further agree to perform the obligations set forth in the cardholder's agreement with the issuer.

Page No. :
Membership No. : PC 907983640
Invoice No.  :

117

1 of 1



Rewards Program ID:
You were checked out by:

You were checked in by:
Total Balance Due:

dvelazqu2
Avelazqu
$0.00

Heritage Inn & Suites Ridgecrest 
(2510)

Ridgecrest, CA 93555
1050 North Norma Street

Heritagefrontdesk@dhmhotels.com
(760) 446-6543

Account:
Date:

Room:
Arrival Date:

Departure Date:
Check In Time:

Check Out Time: 10/6/22 7:58 AM
10/5/22 2:54 PM
10/6/22
10/5/22
130        MSP

10/6/22
32470676

3020 Bridgeway 405
Sausalito, CA 94965

Moran, Jean

Post Date Description Comment Unit Price Quantity Amount
10/5/22 Room Charge #130 Moran, Jean 118.15 1 $118.15
10/5/22 State Tourism Fee 0.23 1 $0.23
10/5/22 Transient Occupancy Tax 11.82 1 $11.82
10/5/22 Local Tourism Tax 3.54 1 $3.54
10/6/22 Visa Payment -133.74 1 ($133.74)

XXXXXXXXXXXX8568

Folio Summary 10/5/22 - 10/6/22

Room Charge 1 $118.15
State Tourism Fee 1 $0.23
Transient Occupancy Tax 1 $11.82
Local Tourism Tax 1 $3.54
Visa Payment 1 ($133.74)

Balance Due: $0.00

x_______________________________________________________







Invoice for Stetson Enginners Project # 2652-2002-06

INVOICE TO
INVOICE NUMBER:

Stetson Engineers Inc
Attn:   Accounts   Payable DATE:
2171 East Francisco Blvd., Suite K
San Rafael, CA 94901 AMOUNT:

Terms:

Period Billed

Project #2652-2002-06 From To

Net Amount:  72,000.00  Total  (Not to exceed)

DRI Account #  GR15120  / AWD-06-00000914  /  RC0030
PI :  Bacon, Steve

Cost Elements/Services Current Cumulative

Stetson Engineers Project #2652-2002-06

Salary: Hours Rate Current Cumulative

Bacon, Steve 113.3683 166.37 18,861.08 36,263.18

Chapman, Jenny 0.0000 188.67 0.00 1,033.51

Rybarski, Susan 38.1890 102.38 3,909.79 8,741.39

Travel: 713.82 713.82

Operating: 181.47 1,372.15

Total 23,666.17 48,124.06

Total Amount Due This Invoice 23,666.17

Budget Amount  Task  01 : 72,000.00     
Invoiced To Date : 48,124.06

Budget  Balance - Task  01 : 23,875.94     

11/14/22
Kathy Rodriguez, Accounting Assistant II Date
(775) 673-7476
          Make Check Payable To:  Board of Regents Mail Check To: Desert Research Institute

Financial  Services  Office
2215 Raggio Parkway
Reno, Nevada    89512-1095

           * Please return Invoice Copy with Check * Tax I.D. # 886000024

 "I certify to the best of my ability that all expenditures reported are for appropriate purposes and in accordance with the provisions of the award document."

CI-06-8011   /  07

11/14/22

$23,666.17

Net 30 Days

Contract/Grant/Agreement/Purchase Order

10/1/2022 10/31/2022







Nichole Weedman 10/7/2022

10/3/202210/2/2022 10/4/2022 10/5/2022 10/6/2022

Ridgecrest, CA          Oct 2-6, 2022

Starbucks - 6.45
Albertsons (3 days) - 24.99

Albertsons (3 days) - 36.32

Panda Express
10.28

Domino's
17.28

Bangkok House
17.52

Dutch Bros
9.65
Panda Express
8.70 40.14

45.97

45.08

Walmart (1)
77.67

Inyokern (2)
Home Depot (3)
FedEx (4) 

Home Depot (5)
Buttermilk (6)
FedEx (7)

Walmart (8)
Buttermilk (9)
Sam's (10)

The Barn (11)

1. Walmart - field supplies (icepacks for WQ sample shipments): $77.67
2. Inyokern Market - ice for WQ samples: $5.80
3. Home Depot - field supplies (carabiners for WQ sample deployment): $51.83
4. FedEx - overnight shipment of WQ samples to lab: $105.49
5. Home Depot - field supplies (addtional carabiners for WQ sample deployment): $ 71.25
6. Buttermilk Acres - ice for WQ samples: $10.70
7. FedEx - overnight shipment of WQ samples to lab: $175.49
8. Walmart - field supplies (icepacks for WQ sample shipments): $50.75
9. Buttermilk Acres - ice for WQ samples: $6.42
10. Sam's Place Minimart - ice for WQ samples: $12.31
11. The Barn - ice for WQ samples: $11.45

579.16

616.52

355.91

790.97

$2473.75
$2473.75

$2473.75

10/7/2022
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Invoice
Date

9/30/2022
Invoice #

14153

Bill To:
Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority
100 W California Ave
Ridgecrest, CA 93555

P.O. No. Due Date

11/15/2022

Inv Sent

10/24/2022

Total

PO Box 1350
Carmel Valley, CA 93924

Description AmountDate
Reimbursable Expenses for September -  City of 
Ridgecrest Monthly Rent and Software Simplified 
($300+$5125.00) - please see attached

5,425.009/30/2022

$5,425.00



AGREEMENT FOR LEASE OF 
100 W. CALIFORNIA AVENUE, RIDGECREST, CA 

by and between 

THE CITY OF RIDGECREST AND 
REGIONAL GOVERNMENT SERVICES 

AGREEMENT: 

Premises:  For and in consideration of the terms, covenants, and conditions contained in this 
Agreement, City leases to RGS, and RGS leases from City, an approximate 210 square foot 
office space located along with the monthly use of the City’s conference room located at 100 
W. California Avenue., Ridgecrest, County of Kern, State of California, depicted on the floor
plan attached as Exhibit “A” (“Premises”).

Term: The initial term of this Agreement (“Term”) shall commence on the Execution Date 
and terminate one year (12 months) thereafter, unless sooner terminated or extended as 
provided in this Agreement. 

Option to Extend Term: Provided RGS is not in default of any of the terms, covenants, or 
conditions of this Agreement, RGS shall have one option to request an extension of the 
initial Term for a two-year period (“Option Term”).  RGS may exercise the option by 
giving the City’s City Manager (“CM”) written notice of RGS’s desire to extend, not less 
than 60 days prior to expiration of the initial Term.  The CM, at the CM’s sole discretion, 
may accept or reject the request to extend. 

4. Right to Terminate:   Either Party may terminate this Agreement for any reason by 
providing a 60-day prior written notice to the other Party. 

5. Hold Over:  If RGS holds over after the expiration of the Term, with the express or
implied consent of City, such holding over shall be a tenancy only from month to month and shall be 
governed by the terms, covenants, and conditions contained in this Agreement.  

6. Rental Consideration:

a. In General: As consideration for the lease of the Premises during the Term, RGS
shall pay to City in lawful money of the United States, to CM at 100 W. CALIFORNIA AVENUE, 
RIDGECREST, CA, or to such persons and at such places as may be designated from time to time by 
City. The first rental payment shall be paid within 30 days of the Execution Date, and thereafter for the 
balance of the Term, shall be paid on or before the first of each month. In the event RGS occupies the 
Premises for a partial month at any time, RGS shall only be responsible for a prorated portion of the 
Rent. 

b. Fair Market Rental Value:  The fair market rental rate of the facility is 
determined to be $300 per month ($1.43 per square foot).  

RGSLaptop5CG732316C
Highlight



Software Simplified
PO Box 1269
Tracy, CA  95378
209-229-8370
info@softsimp.com
www.softsimp.com

Invoice

BILL TO

Regional Government Services
Attn: Roberto Moreno

INVOICE # DATE TOTAL DUE DUE DATE TERMS ENCLOSED

3640 08/18/2022 $5,125.00 09/17/2022 Net 30

DATE ACTIVITY DESCRIPTION QTY RATE AMOUNT

08/18/2022 Sales Database Design, Implementation 
and Training: Indian Wells Valley 
Groundwater Authority; $10,250 @ 
50%

5,125.00 5,125.00

ACH Information
Wells Fargo Bank
Routing Number: 121042882
Account Number: 8888994764

BALANCE DUE $5,125.00





Invoice
Date

10/31/2022
Invoice #

14263

Bill To:
Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority
100 W California Ave
Ridgecrest, CA 93555

P.O. No. Due Date

12/15/2022

Inv Sent

11/29/2022

Total

PO Box 1350
Carmel Valley, CA 93924

Description AmountDate
Reimbursable Expenses for October -  City of Ridegecrest
Monthly Rent - please see attached

300.00

$300.00

10/31/22



AGREEMENT FOR LEASE OF 
100 W. CALIFORNIA AVENUE, RIDGECREST, CA 

by and between 

THE CITY OF RIDGECREST AND 
REGIONAL GOVERNMENT SERVICES 

AGREEMENT: 

Premises:  For and in consideration of the terms, covenants, and conditions contained in this 
Agreement, City leases to RGS, and RGS leases from City, an approximate 210 square foot 
office space located along with the monthly use of the City’s conference room located at 100 
W. California Avenue., Ridgecrest, County of Kern, State of California, depicted on the floor
plan attached as Exhibit “A” (“Premises”).

Term: The initial term of this Agreement (“Term”) shall commence on the Execution Date 
and terminate one year (12 months) thereafter, unless sooner terminated or extended as 
provided in this Agreement. 

Option to Extend Term: Provided RGS is not in default of any of the terms, covenants, or 
conditions of this Agreement, RGS shall have one option to request an extension of the 
initial Term for a two-year period (“Option Term”).  RGS may exercise the option by 
giving the City’s City Manager (“CM”) written notice of RGS’s desire to extend, not less 
than 60 days prior to expiration of the initial Term.  The CM, at the CM’s sole discretion, 
may accept or reject the request to extend. 

4. Right to Terminate:   Either Party may terminate this Agreement for any reason by 
providing a 60-day prior written notice to the other Party. 

5. Hold Over:  If RGS holds over after the expiration of the Term, with the express or
implied consent of City, such holding over shall be a tenancy only from month to month and shall be 
governed by the terms, covenants, and conditions contained in this Agreement.  

6. Rental Consideration:

a. In General: As consideration for the lease of the Premises during the Term, RGS
shall pay to City in lawful money of the United States, to CM at 100 W. CALIFORNIA AVENUE, 
RIDGECREST, CA, or to such persons and at such places as may be designated from time to time by 
City. The first rental payment shall be paid within 30 days of the Execution Date, and thereafter for the 
balance of the Term, shall be paid on or before the first of each month. In the event RGS occupies the 
Premises for a partial month at any time, RGS shall only be responsible for a prorated portion of the 
Rent. 

b. Fair Market Rental Value:  The fair market rental rate of the facility is 
determined to be $300 per month ($1.43 per square foot).  

RGSLaptop5CG732316C
Highlight





Invoice
Date

10/31/2022
Invoice #

14186

Bill To:
Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority
100 W California Ave
Ridgecrest, CA 93555

P.O. No. Due Date

11/30/2022

Inv Sent

11/16/2022

Total

PO Box 1350
Carmel Valley, CA 93924

Description AmountDate
Contract Services for October - please see attached 25,019.2510/31/2022

$25,019.25



Month:  

Monthly

Advisor Reg Hrs Bill Rate Reg Hrs Bill Rate Total Billed

CT 33.50 130.00$  18.00 130.00$  6,695.00$    
AK 66.70 105.00$  51.40 105.00$  12,400.50$  
JK 0.00 -$        0.00 -$        -$            
GL 0.00 -$        0.00 -$        -$            
AM 0.00 -$        0.00 -$        -$            
GS 30.75 137.00$  8.00 137.00$  5,308.75$    
EF 0.00 -$        0.00 -$        -$            
RM 1.50 164.00$  2.25 164.00$  615.00$       

Totals 132.45 79.65 25,019.25$  

Indian Wells Valley

Oct, 2022

Hours and Rates by Pay Period

1st -15th 16th - EOM

Indian Wells 11/11/2022



Client Activity Report
October 2022

Client Task Comment Hours

Client Hours 212.10Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority
Task Hours 150.904070-000 - IWVGA General Administration

RGS team call board meeting prep email correspondence meeting coordination 
document prep for signature document review

6.0010/3/2022

GA team meeting; pipeline study status meeting; responses to lender questions; 
emails and correspondence

3.0010/3/2022

Review grant information; finalize and send responses to lender questions; 
meeting coordination; attend facilitation meeting

5.0010/4/2022

Email correspondence Board meeting prep Meeting coordination Document 
review Litigation support

5.6010/4/2022

Mtg w/WD re grant opportunity; GA staff meeting; budget meeting, various emails 3.0010/5/2022

Email correspondence Board meeting prep Litigation support Meeting 
coordination SWM call Staff call Budget call

8.0010/5/2022

Email correspondence Board meeting prep Document signature prep Meeting 
coordination

4.5010/6/2022

Prepare responses to new lender questions; meeting coordination; research dry 
well location; review and respond to various emails

2.0010/6/2022

Email correspondence Board meeting prep Call with staff member  Document 
review Meeting with WH Meeting with Stark Street

6.5010/7/2022

Mtg w/finance team; mtg w/Self Help; prepare staff reports and items for board 
agenda; review agenda

3.5010/7/2022

Review final proposed budget and prepare staff report for agenda; review final 
agenda and packet

1.5010/8/2022

Document review Board meeting prep Email correspondence 3.7010/8/2022

Board packet posting / distribution 2.0010/9/2022

GA team mtg; review and respond to emails 1.0010/10/2022

Board meeting prep RGS team call Email correspondence  Call with staff member 5.8010/10/2022

Meeting w/US Army Corps of Engineers; research and prepare responses to 
additional bank questions; review and respond to various emails

2.0010/11/2022

Email correspondence Board meeting prep Financing support Call with staff 
member Call with constituent

5.8010/11/2022

Attend pre-meeting, board meeting closed session and open session; travel time 8.0010/12/2022

Board meeting Email correspondence 8.0010/12/2022

Call w/CCG; GA staff de-brief meeting; audit-related work, emails, follow-up w/legal 3.5010/13/2022

Email correspondence  Meeting coordination Minutes Staff call Agenda and action 
register updates

4.3010/13/2022

Prepare letters for auditors; review, respond and follow up to various emails 1.0010/14/2022

GA team meeting; call w/CCG; begin draft letter re import water project; meeting 
coordination; various emails

2.5010/17/2022

Email correspondence, call with RGS team, minutes, call with constituent, 
document distribution

3.5010/17/2022

Call w/WRM and CCG; call w/legal counsel; call w/CCG, call w/finance team and 
auditor; follow up on audit needs; work on import water project letter

4.0010/18/2022

Email correspondence, call with constituent, call with staff/CCG 3.8010/18/2022

Email correspondence, call with board member, meeting assistance 2.6010/19/2022

Follow up on import water project letter; meeting coordination; various emails 1.5010/19/2022

PAC meeting follow up; review revisions to import water project letter; various 
emails and follow-up

1.5010/20/2022



Client Activity Report
October 2022

Client Task Comment Hours

Email correspondence 1.0010/20/2022

Email correspondence, letter to IWVWD, meeting coordination, call with staff 
member

3.4010/21/2022

Finalize letter to WD; review and respond to various emails 1.0010/21/2022

Review and respond to various emails 0.5010/24/2022

Email correspondence, call with staff member, letter to IWVWD, meeting 
coordination, litigation assistance

4.7010/24/2022

Review and respond to various emails 0.5010/25/2022

Email correspondence, meeting coordination, board meeting prep, call with 
constituent

3.2010/25/2022

GA Staff meeting; meeting coordination; organize prep of legal info for audit; 
review correspondence and documents from Army Corps of Engineers and US 
Parks Service

2.0010/26/2022

Email correspondence, call with Stetson team, rose valley application, meeting 
coordination, staff call, board meeting prep

8.0010/26/2022

Email correspondence, Rose valley application, meeting at City, call with staff 
member, document review

6.0010/27/2022

Meeting w/Congr McCarthy staff, CCG and GA staff; review and respond to emails 2.0010/27/2022

Review legal and financial information for audit; review and respond to emails 1.0010/28/2022

Monthly report forms 3.0010/28/2022

Call w/finance staff and auditor; call w/legal counsel; various emails and follow up 1.5010/31/2022

Task Hours 58.704070-001 - IWVGA Finance
GS: RGS/IWVGA: IWVGA Staff Meeting; Budget Mtg w/Stetson; Budget WIP 1.0010/3/2022

audit WIP 0.3010/3/2022

Deposit detail Voucher request Invoice tracker updates 2.0010/4/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: Budget WIP; Staff Budget Review 6.0010/5/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP 0.5010/6/2022

Audit WIP Invoice tracker udpates 1.5010/7/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP; Budget WIP 8.2510/7/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP; Budget WIP 5.2510/8/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: IWVGA Staff Meeting; Budget Review 0.7510/10/2022

Call with GA staff on financial statements 0.5010/12/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: IWVGA Board Mtg; Audit WIP; call w/ RM; auditors 4.2510/12/2022

Call with GA staff on financial statements 0.5010/13/2022

Payment processing 1.7010/13/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP; Staff Debrief 1.5010/13/2022

Payment processing 1.0010/14/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP; Call wRM 1.2510/14/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: IWVGA Staff Meeting; Audit WIP 0.7510/17/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: Mtg w/B&A; Audit WIP 2.0010/18/2022

voucher requests 1.2010/18/2022

Payment processing 2.0010/19/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: Mtg wRM; Audit WIP 1.2510/20/2022

Voucher requests, audit WIP, tracker updates 3.0010/20/2022

Call with GA staff on financial statements 1.0010/20/2022



Client Activity Report
October 2022

Client Task Comment Hours

payment processing 2.0010/21/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP 2.0010/21/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: IWVGA Staff Meeting; Audit WIP 0.5010/26/2022

Deposit 2.0010/27/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: IWVGA Staff Meeting; Audit WIP 0.5010/28/2022

Call with GA staff ; review documents 0.2510/28/2022

EROD, payment tracker updates. 2.0010/31/2022

Call with GA staff and auditors 0.7510/31/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: IWVGA Audit Mtg WIP 1.0010/31/2022

Review documentation on audit 0.2510/31/2022

Task Hours 2.504070-003 - IWVGA MIP Implementation
Call with GA staff on MIP setup 0.5010/13/2022

GS: RGS/IWVGA: Meeting w RM; FY23 additions to COA 2.0010/13/2022





Capitol Core Group, Inc.
205 Cartwheel Bend (Operations Dept.)
Austin, TX  78738 US
512.568.3084
operations@capitolcore.com
www.capitolcore.com

BILL TO
Indian Wells Valley Groundwater 
Authority
500 West Ridgecrest Blvd.
Ridgecrest, California  93555
USA

INVOICE 2022-060

DATE 12/05/2022    TERMS Net 45

DUE DATE 01/19/2023

VENDOR ID INVOICE PERIOD
195953 November 2022

DATE ACCOUNT SUMMARY AMOUNT

11/01/2022 Balance Forward 18,837.50
Other payments and credits after 11/01/2022 through 12/04/2022 0.00

12/05/2022 Other invoices from this date 0.00
12/05/2022 Other payments from this date -18,837.50

New charges (details below) 15,387.50
Total Amount Due 15,387.50

ACTIVITY HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Charges
Task 1: Identify and Secure Imported Water Supplies
Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask B:  Interconnection: Alignment (non-lobbying meetings and 
internal) {McKinney}

4 250.00 1,000.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask A:  Meeting w/ Public Agency Seller-1 {Tatum}

1 250.00 250.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask A:  Negotiations w/ Jackson Ranch {Tatum}

1.50 250.00 375.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask B:  RRG Meeting re: Interconnection {Tatum}

1 250.00 250.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask D: New Water Identification meetings {Tatum}

4 250.00 1,000.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask D: New Water Meetings w/ Sellers {Tatum}

3 250.00 750.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask A:  Discussion/Negotiation w/ Public Agency Seller-1 {Simonetti}

2 225.00 450.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask B:  Interconnection -- Alignment and ROW/Permitting (non-
lobbying) {Simonetti}

8 225.00 1,800.00



ACTIVITY HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask D:  New Water Supply Meetings {Simonetti}

3.50 225.00 787.50

Invoice Total Task 1: $6,662.50 (27 hours)
Task 2: Secure Federal Funding
Government Relations:Federal
Congressional: WRDA 22 U.S. Senate amendment -- Rep. McCarthy, 
USACE calls {McKinney}

6 250.00 1,500.00

Government Relations:Federal
Congressional:  Interconnection -- Senator Feinstein, preparation and follow-
up briefing {McKinney}

2.25 250.00 562.50

Government Relations:Federal
Agency:  USACE Interconnection/Briefings and document preparation 
{McKinney}

4 250.00 1,000.00

Government Relations:Federal
Congressional:  FY2023 NDAA Senate Lobbying {McKinney}

2 250.00 500.00

Government Relations:Federal
Congressional:  WRDA-22 Direct Advocacy and amendment re-write 
{Simonetti}

3.25 225.00 731.25

Government Relations:Federal
Congressional:  NDAA and WRDA briefing w/ Rep. McCarthy {Simonetti}

1.50 225.00 337.50

Government Relations:Federal
Congressional:  Senate Briefings Interconnection (Sen. Feinstein) and 
materials preparation {Simonetti}

3.75 225.00 843.75

Invoice Total Task 2: $5,475.00 (23 hours)
Task 3:  Secure State Funding
Government Relations:California
Agency;  OPR/GMC Briefings Cal-DCIP proposal {McKinney}

1 250.00 250.00

Government Relations:California
Legislative:  Interconnection -- Asm. Fong briefing {McKinney}

1.25 250.00 312.50

Government Relations:California
Legislative: 2023-2024 State Budget Analysis and Legislative ID {Split) 
{McKinney}

2 250.00 500.00

Government Relations:California
Agency:  Meeting w/ OPR re: 2023-2024 Cal-DCIP Proposal {Simonetti}

1 225.00 225.00

Government Relations:California
Legislative:  Interconnection briefing Asm Fong, meeting prep. Sen. Grove 
{Simonetti}

1 225.00 225.00

Invoice Total Task 3: $1,512.50 (6.25 hours)
Task 4: Project Administration
Administrative
Board Meeting November  {Tatum}

2 250.00 500.00

Administrative
Board Meeting and materials preparation {Simonetti}

4.50 225.00 1,012.50

Administrative
Client Meetings (various) {Simonetti}

1 225.00 225.00

Invoice Total Task 4: $1,737.50 (7.5 hours)
---------------



ACTIVITY HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Compliance Reporting Notes:
Federal Reporting for Invoice IWVGA: $4,975.00
Federal Reporting for Invoice City of RIdgecrest: $500.00
State Reporting for Invoice IWVGA:$1,037.50
State Reporting for Invoice City of Ridgecrest: $475.00
---------------

Thank you for your business.  Please make checks payable to 
Capitol Core Group, Inc.

TOTAL OF NEW 
CHARGES 15,387.50

TOTAL DUE $15,387.50





Client Project #:

Project Name: Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority-Imported Water Pipeline Alignment Study

April Keigwin
Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority
100 West California Avenue
Ridgecrest, CA  93555

November 10, 2022
Project: No: 04101-22-001
Invoice No: 96294

455 W. Fir Avenue
Clovis, CA 93611

(559) 449-2700
Fax (559) 449-2715

Screened eleven alignments down to three; made additional field visits to confirmthey are viable.  Submitted draft tech 
memo for Task 2.  Continued analysis of blending tank, pump station hydraulics, and environmental impacts.  Began 
review of the three alignments looking for geologic issues that could impact them.
Professional Services from October 1, 2022 to October 31, 2022
          Phase: T02 Imported Water Demands Determination
 Labor

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Engineer 1.50 184.00 276.00
Principal Engineer 3.00 225.00 675.00
Project Administrator .20 105.00 21.00

Totals 4.70 972.00
Total Labor 972.00

             $972.00Total this Phase:

  Phase: T03 Delivery & Connection Points Evaluation
 Labor

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Engineer 6.50 184.00 1,196.00

Totals 6.50 1,196.00
Total Labor 1,196.00

             $1,196.00Total this Phase:

  Phase: T04 Preliminary Alignment Option Development
 Labor

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Engineer 1.50 153.00 229.50
Senior Engineer 144.10 184.00 26,514.40
Senior Technician 10.00 136.00 1,360.00
Assistant Engineer 22.00 118.00 2,596.00
Principal Engineer 19.60 225.00 4,410.00
Senior GIS Specialist 4.70 160.00 752.00
Travel Time 2.50 80.00 200.00

Totals 204.40 36,061.90
Total Labor 36,061.90

Consultants

Consultants 4,709.25
Total Consultants 4,709.25 4,709.25

*** Please make checks payable to Provost & Pritchard Consulting Group ***
For billing inquiries, please email BillingInquiries@ppeng.com.



Reimbursable Expenses

Printing, Repro & Photographs 8.89
Travel & Mileage 697.92
Other Direct Reimb Expenses 53.70

Total Reimbursables 760.51 760.51

           $41,531.66Total this Phase:

  Phase: T06 Pipeline Alignment Options Analysis
 Labor

Hours Rate Amount
Assistant Engineer 1.20 104.00 124.80
Principal Planner .50 182.00 91.00
Associate GIS Specialist .50 106.00 53.00

Totals 2.20 268.80
Total Labor 268.80

             $268.80Total this Phase:

  Phase: T07 Pipeline Alignment Options Comparison
 Labor

Hours Rate Amount
Principal Planner 1.00 182.00 182.00
Associate GIS Specialist 3.00 106.00 318.00

Totals 4.00 500.00
Total Labor 500.00

             $500.00Total this Phase:

  Phase: T08 Alternative Alignment Technical Memo
 Labor

Hours Rate Amount
Associate Biologist 5.40 101.00 545.40
Associate Biologist 12.20 115.00 1,403.00
Travel Time 5.40 80.00 432.00

Totals 23.00 2,380.40
Total Labor 2,380.40

             $2,380.40Total this Phase:

  Phase: T09 Project Management
 Labor

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Engineer 1.30 184.00 239.20
Principal Engineer 1.30 205.00 266.50
Principal Engineer 3.10 195.00 604.50
Principal Engineer 25.40 225.00 5,715.00
Senior GIS Specialist 13.90 142.00 1,973.80
Assistant Envir. Spec. 3.00 105.00 315.00
Principal Const. Manager 1.30 210.00 273.00

Totals 49.30 9,387.00
Total Labor 9,387.00

 

Page 2*** Please make checks payable to Provost & Pritchard Consulting Group ***
For billing inquiries, please email BillingInquiries@ppeng.com.

Project 9629404101-22-001 Imported Water Pipeline Alignment Study Invoice



Reimbursable Expenses

Other Direct Reimb Expenses 1,966.05
Total Reimbursables 1,966.05 1,966.05

           $11,353.05Total this Phase:

   Billing Limits Current Prior To-Date

Total Billings 58,201.91 59,165.29 117,367.20
Budget 449,100.00
Budget Remaining 331,732.80

     $58,201.91Total this Invoice

  

Page 3*** Please make checks payable to Provost & Pritchard Consulting Group ***
For billing inquiries, please email BillingInquiries@ppeng.com.

Project 9629404101-22-001 Imported Water Pipeline Alignment Study Invoice



9:54:54 AMInvoice 96294 Dated 11/10/2022Provost & Pritchard Consulting Group

Monday, November 14, 2022Billing Backup

Phase: T02 Imported Water Demands Determination

Labor

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Engineer
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/19/2022    1.50 184.00  276.00
Principal Engineer
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/18/2022    1.30 225.00  292.50
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/19/2022    1.70 225.00  382.50
Project Administrator
1119 - Sales, Laurie 10/19/2022    .20 105.00  21.00

Totals 4.70 972.00
Total Labor 972.00

   Total this Phase: $972.00

Phase: T03 Delivery & Connection Points Evaluation

Labor

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Engineer
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/22/2022    1.00 184.00  184.00
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/23/2022    2.50 184.00  460.00
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/26/2022    1.50 184.00  276.00
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/27/2022    1.50 184.00  276.00

Totals 6.50 1,196.00
Total Labor 1,196.00

   Total this Phase: $1,196.00

Phase: T04 Preliminary Alignment Option Development

Labor

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Engineer
1005 - Jacobson, Nicholas 10/31/2022    1.50 153.00  229.50
Senior Engineer
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/3/2022    6.70 184.00  1,232.80
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/4/2022    5.70 184.00  1,048.80
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/5/2022    6.00 184.00  1,104.00
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/6/2022    6.00 184.00  1,104.00
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/7/2022    5.00 184.00  920.00
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/10/2022    5.50 184.00  1,012.00
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/11/2022    6.00 184.00  1,104.00
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/12/2022    5.50 184.00  1,012.00
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/13/2022    2.50 184.00  460.00
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/14/2022    5.50 184.00  1,012.00
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/16/2022    2.50 184.00  460.00
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/17/2022    7.70 184.00  1,416.80

Page 4*** Please make checks payable to Provost & Pritchard Consulting Group ***
For billing inquiries, please email BillingInquiries@ppeng.com.

Project 9629404101-22-001 Imported Water Pipeline Alignment Study Invoice



1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/18/2022    5.00 184.00  920.00
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/19/2022    5.30 184.00  975.20
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/20/2022    8.30 184.00  1,527.20
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/21/2022    6.70 184.00  1,232.80
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/24/2022    8.80 184.00  1,619.20
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/25/2022    9.30 184.00  1,711.20
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/26/2022    7.80 184.00  1,435.20
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/27/2022    6.30 184.00  1,159.20
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/28/2022    10.00 184.00  1,840.00
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/29/2022    1.00 184.00  184.00
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/30/2022    2.00 184.00  368.00
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/31/2022    .70 184.00  128.80
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/31/2022    8.30 184.00  1,527.20
Senior Technician
1015 - Lowell, Nicholas 10/6/2022    5.00 136.00  680.00
1015 - Lowell, Nicholas 10/11/2022    5.00 136.00  680.00
Assistant Engineer
1026 - Holmes, Tonia 10/7/2022    .80 118.00  94.40
1026 - Poire, Luis 10/3/2022    1.00 118.00  118.00
1026 - Poire, Luis 10/4/2022    4.00 118.00  472.00
1026 - Poire, Luis 10/5/2022    .50 118.00  59.00
1026 - Poire, Luis 10/10/2022    .50 118.00  59.00
1026 - Poire, Luis 10/11/2022    1.00 118.00  118.00
1026 - Poire, Luis 10/14/2022    .50 118.00  59.00
1026 - Poire, Luis 10/18/2022    .50 118.00  59.00
1026 - Poire, Luis 10/19/2022    .50 118.00  59.00
1026 - Poire, Luis 10/24/2022    2.00 118.00  236.00
1026 - Poire, Luis 10/25/2022    5.00 118.00  590.00
1026 - Poire, Luis 10/26/2022    5.70 118.00  672.60
Principal Engineer
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/3/2022    1.00 225.00  225.00
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/4/2022    1.20 225.00  270.00
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/6/2022    1.00 225.00  225.00
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/12/2022    .50 225.00  112.50
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/13/2022    4.00 225.00  900.00
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/14/2022    2.30 225.00  517.50
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/19/2022    1.30 225.00  292.50
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/21/2022    1.50 225.00  337.50
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/26/2022    2.00 225.00  450.00
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/28/2022    4.80 225.00  1,080.00
Senior GIS Specialist
1144 - O'Leary, Gavin 10/26/2022    .40 160.00  64.00
1144 - O'Leary, Gavin 10/27/2022    .40 160.00  64.00
1144 - O'Leary, Gavin 10/28/2022    1.60 160.00  256.00
1144 - O'Leary, Gavin 10/31/2022    2.30 160.00  368.00
Travel Time
40 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/13/2022    1.00 80.00  80.00
40 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/28/2022    1.50 80.00  120.00

Totals 204.40 36,061.90
Total Labor 36,061.90

Consultants

Consultants
AP 55370 11/1/2022 Soils Engineering, Inc / 4101-22-001 T04 / 

Invoice: 34261, 10/27/2022
4,709.25

Total Consultants 4,709.25 4,709.25
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Reimbursable Expenses

Printing, Repro & Photographs
AP 55245 10/31/2022 Michael McGovern / 10/27/22 11X17 Copies 

for Site Visit to Cal City / Invoice: 102822, 
10/28/2022

8.89

Travel & Mileage
AP 55245 10/31/2022 Michael McGovern / 10/28/22 Mileage - Site 

Visit to Cal City / Invoice: 102822, 
10/28/2022

233.60

AP 55234 10/31/2022 Jeffrey Davis / 10/13/22 Mileage - Field Visit 
/ Invoice: 102822, 10/28/2022

221.38

AP 55234 10/31/2022 Jeffrey Davis / 10/28/22 Mileage - Field Visit 
/ Invoice: 102822, 10/28/2022

242.94

Other Direct Reimb Expenses
AP 55234 10/31/2022 Jeffrey Davis / 10/28/22 Lunch / Invoice: 

102822, 10/28/2022
14.41

AP 55234 10/31/2022 Jeffrey Davis / 10/13/22 Lunch w/Mary Beth 
/ Invoice: 102822, 10/28/2022

26.48

AP 55245 10/31/2022 Michael McGovern / 10/28/22 Meal @ Cal 
City during Site Visit / Invoice: 102822, 
10/28/2022

12.81

Total Reimbursables 760.51 760.51

 Total this Phase: $41,531.66

Phase: T06 Pipeline Alignment Options Analysis

Labor

Hours Rate Amount
Assistant Engineer
1011 - Wunderlich, Adam 10/31/2022    1.20 104.00  124.80
Principal Planner
1214 - Giacomini, Dena 10/20/2022    .50 182.00  91.00
Associate GIS Specialist
1227 - Hunter, Cheryl 10/17/2022    .50 106.00  53.00

Totals 2.20 268.80
Total Labor 268.80

   Total this Phase: $268.80

Phase: T07 Pipeline Alignment Options Comparison

Labor

Hours Rate Amount
Principal Planner
1214 - Giacomini, Dena 10/24/2022    .30 182.00  54.60
1214 - Giacomini, Dena 10/25/2022    .50 182.00  91.00
1214 - Giacomini, Dena 10/26/2022    .20 182.00  36.40
Associate GIS Specialist
1227 - Hunter, Cheryl 10/12/2022    3.00 106.00  318.00

Totals 4.00 500.00
Total Labor 500.00

   Total this Phase: $500.00
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Phase: T08 Alternative Alignment Technical Memo

Labor

Hours Rate Amount
Associate Biologist
1235 - Stark, Shaylea 10/3/2022    3.30 101.00  333.30
1235 - Stark, Shaylea 10/4/2022    1.90 101.00  191.90
1235 - Stark, Shaylea 10/5/2022    .10 101.00  10.10
1235 - Stark, Shaylea 10/12/2022    .10 101.00  10.10
Associate Biologist
1237 - Bourne, Mary 10/3/2022    .50 115.00  57.50
1237 - Bourne, Mary 10/4/2022    .30 115.00  34.50
1237 - Bourne, Mary 10/5/2022    .30 115.00  34.50
1237 - Bourne, Mary 10/10/2022    .20 115.00  23.00
1237 - Bourne, Mary 10/11/2022    .80 115.00  92.00
1237 - Bourne, Mary 10/12/2022    2.10 115.00  241.50
1237 - Bourne, Mary 10/13/2022    3.70 115.00  425.50
1237 - Bourne, Mary 10/17/2022    .80 115.00  92.00
1237 - Bourne, Mary 10/18/2022    .40 115.00  46.00
1237 - Bourne, Mary 10/24/2022    .30 115.00  34.50
1237 - Bourne, Mary 10/25/2022    1.60 115.00  184.00
1237 - Bourne, Mary 10/26/2022    .30 115.00  34.50
1237 - Bourne, Mary 10/27/2022    .40 115.00  46.00
1237 - Bourne, Mary 10/31/2022    .50 115.00  57.50
Travel Time
40 - Bourne, Mary 10/13/2022    5.40 80.00  432.00

Totals 23.00 2,380.40
Total Labor 2,380.40

   Total this Phase: $2,380.40

Phase: T09 Project Management

Labor

Hours Rate Amount
Senior Engineer
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/3/2022    .80 184.00  147.20
1006 - McGovern, Michael 10/26/2022    .50 184.00  92.00
Principal Engineer
1102 - Kemp, Matthew 10/26/2022    1.30 205.00  266.50
Principal Engineer
1103 - Eklund, Jeffrey 10/3/2022    .70 195.00  136.50
1103 - Eklund, Jeffrey 10/4/2022    .30 195.00  58.50
1103 - Eklund, Jeffrey 10/5/2022    .80 195.00  156.00
1103 - Eklund, Jeffrey 10/17/2022    .30 195.00  58.50
1103 - Eklund, Jeffrey 10/18/2022    1.00 195.00  195.00
Principal Engineer
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/3/2022    .80 225.00  180.00
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/4/2022    1.00 225.00  225.00
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/5/2022    1.00 225.00  225.00
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/6/2022    1.00 225.00  225.00
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/10/2022    1.20 225.00  270.00
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/11/2022    2.70 225.00  607.50
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/12/2022    1.30 225.00  292.50
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/17/2022    2.50 225.00  562.50
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/18/2022    2.00 225.00  450.00
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1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/20/2022    1.30 225.00  292.50
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/21/2022    1.00 225.00  225.00
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/24/2022    2.30 225.00  517.50
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/25/2022    1.00 225.00  225.00
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/26/2022    2.00 225.00  450.00
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/27/2022    1.40 225.00  315.00
1105 - Davis, Jeffrey 10/31/2022    2.90 225.00  652.50
Senior GIS Specialist
1142 - Slater, Philip 10/3/2022    2.20 142.00  312.40
1142 - Slater, Philip 10/4/2022    3.20 142.00  454.40
1142 - Slater, Philip 10/5/2022    .50 142.00  71.00
1142 - Slater, Philip 10/6/2022    .20 142.00  28.40
1142 - Slater, Philip 10/7/2022    .60 142.00  85.20
1142 - Slater, Philip 10/10/2022    3.10 142.00  440.20
1142 - Slater, Philip 10/11/2022    .80 142.00  113.60
1142 - Slater, Philip 10/17/2022    1.10 142.00  156.20
1142 - Slater, Philip 10/18/2022    .90 142.00  127.80
1142 - Slater, Philip 10/21/2022    .30 142.00  42.60
1142 - Slater, Philip 10/24/2022    1.00 142.00  142.00
Assistant Envir. Spec.
1167 - McCall, Kira 10/5/2022    .70 105.00  73.50
1167 - McCall, Kira 10/10/2022    .70 105.00  73.50
1167 - McCall, Kira 10/11/2022    .30 105.00  31.50
1167 - McCall, Kira 10/18/2022    1.00 105.00  105.00
1167 - McCall, Kira 10/19/2022    .30 105.00  31.50
Principal Const. Manager
1417 - Darnley, Rick 10/26/2022    1.30 210.00  273.00

Totals 49.30 9,387.00
Total Labor 9,387.00

 Reimbursable Expenses

Other Direct Reimb Expenses
AP 55261 10/20/2022 Business Card (7207) / 9/15/22 AGOL 

License / Invoice: 4030 October 2022, 
10/4/2022

1,966.05

Total Reimbursables 1,966.05 1,966.05

 Total this Phase: $11,353.05

$58,201.91Total this Project:

$58,201.91Total this Report
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SOILS ENGINEERING, INC.

Date 10/27/2022

Invoice # 34261

PROVOST & PRICHARD CONSULTING GROUP
ATTN: MR. MICHAEL MCGOVERN
1800 30TH STREET, SUITE 280
BAKERSFIELD, CA 93301
USA

PRELIMINARY SOILS & GEOTECHNICAL
EVALUATION FOR THE INDIAN WELLS VALLEY GW
AUTHORITY IMPORTED WATER PIPELINE ALIGNME
STUDY, CALIFORNIA CITY TO RIDGECREST

Project # 18600 Indian ...

Total

Balance Due

Payments/Credits

All invoices are due and payable upon presentation and delinquent thirty (30) days and thereafter.  
A "FINANCE CHARGE" of 1.5% (A.P.R. of 18%) will be charged to the unpaid balance

Remit payment to: 
P.O. Box 21928, Bakersfield, CA 93390

Service Date Description Qty/Hours Rate Amount

10/27/2022 Registered Engineer or Geologist, REPA (Initial Preliminary Soils
and Geological Evaluation Summary)

20.000 195.00 3,900.00

10/27/2022 Senior Registered Engineer or Principal (Report Review) 1.000 195.00 195.00

$4,095.00

$4,095.00

$0.00

4101-22-001          004
jd 11.8.22

S347        4095.00
5140.1

Amber Rodgers
New Stamp_1



Provost Pritchard Consulting Group

Expense Reimbursement Claim

Employee Name: Invoice# Invoice Date

Employee #: Description: Gross:

Week Ending:

Expense

 Date

Project

Manager

PM

Approval Job Number Phase Expense Reason Exp Code G/L Account# Miles

Amount

(attach Reciepts)

TOTAL Mileage
$  

TOTAL $  

Current IRS Mileage Rate:

RGL Approval:

A
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Accounting Use Only

Accounting Use Only

Accounting Use Only

Accounting Use Only$ 514.50Mileage & Expense
102822 10/28/22

Chantel Vercauteren
Line





Provost Pritchard Consulting Group

Expense Reimbursement Claim

Employee Name: Invoice# Invoice Date

Employee #: Description: Gross:

Week Ending:

Expense

 Date

Project

Manager

PM

Approval Job Number Phase Expense Reason Exp Code G/L Account# Miles

Amount

(attach Reciepts)

TOTAL Mileage
$  

TOTAL $  

Current IRS Mileage Rate:

RGL Approval:

A

c

c

o

u

n

t

i

n

g

U

s

e
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l

y

A

c
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O
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y

Accounting Use Only

Accounting Use Only

Accounting Use Only

Accounting Use Only$ 549.31

$        549.31

Mileage & Expense
102822 10/28/22

Chantel Vercauteren
Line

Angelina Camarena
Rectangle

Angelina Camarena
Rectangle

Angelina Camarena
Line

Angelina Camarena
Line





_________________________________________________________________________________________________

Item Qty        Material Number Price

_________________________________________________________________________________________________
10             9 153147           512.91 

ArcGIS Online Viewer Annual Subscription
Start Date:  09/13/2022
End  Date:  04/08/2023

20             6 165533         1,196.70 
ArcGIS Online Mobile Worker Annual Subscription
Start Date:  09/13/2022
End  Date:  04/08/2023

Item Subtotal             1,709.61 
Amt. Prepaid              1,709.61-

Total: USD           0.00 

Bill to:
Philip Slater
Provost & Pritchard Engineering Gro
dba Provost & Pritchard Consulting
455 W Fir Ave
Clovis CA  93611-0242

Ship to:
Philip Slater
Provost & Pritchard Engineering Gro
dba Provost & Pritchard Consulting
455 W Fir Ave
Clovis CA  93611-0242

  380 New York Street
  Redlands,CA-92373
  Phone:(909)793-2853

____

Invoice : 94322021 Document date : 09/13/2022
Order    : 4250154 Delivery    :
Customer    : 143284
Customer PO : 552078931388
P.O. Date : 09/13/2022
End User : 143284 Provost & Pritchard Engineering Gro
Project    :

Page : 1

For questions regarding this document, please contact Customer Service at 888-377-4575.
Terms of payment: Prepaid
The line items included in this transaction are governed exclusively by the terms of the above-referenced contract, if any, or, where
applicable, Esri's standard terms and conditions at www.esri.com/legal/software-license.

'Invoice'
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