
Itemized Invoice Packet 
Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority 

Regular Board Meeting 
August 10, 2022 





City of Ridgecrest
Attn: Alan Christensen
100 W. California Ave.
Ridgecrest, CA 93555

Professional Services through 6/30/2022

Project #: 2652 Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority

2652-59

08/04/22

Invoice Number:

Invoice Date:

Invoice

Water Resources Management 2022
01 - Meetings & Prep

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $4,858.5020.50 $237.00
Supervisor I $978.504.75 $206.00
Senior Associate $352.002.75 $128.00
Associate III $1,665.0015.00 $111.00

$7,854.00Professional Services Subtotal:
Reimbursables Charge

Reproduction (Color) $128.16
Reproduction $31.80

$159.96Reimbursables Subtotal:

$8,013.96Meetings & Prep Subtotal:
02 - Prop 1 / Prop 68 Grant Administration

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Senior Associate $384.003.00 $128.00
Assistant I $1,078.0011.00 $98.00

$1,462.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$1,462.00Prop 1 / Prop 68 Grant Administration Subtotal:
03 - Grant Review & Application Preparation

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $2,962.5012.50 $237.00
Supervisor I $1,905.509.25 $206.00
Senior Associate $2,048.0016.00 $128.00
Associate III $2,830.5025.50 $111.00
Assistant I $245.002.50 $98.00

$9,991.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$9,991.50Grant Review & Application Preparation Subtotal:
04 - Data Mgmt System Support

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $824.004.00 $206.00
Associate I $7,167.5058.75 $122.00
Senior Assistant $51.500.50 $103.00

$8,043.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$8,043.00Data Mgmt System Support Subtotal:
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05 - General Project Mgmt
Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $721.003.50 $206.00
Senior Associate $128.001.00 $128.00
Associate III $305.252.75 $111.00

$1,154.25Professional Services Subtotal:

$1,154.25General Project Mgmt Subtotal:
06 - Model Transfer & Upgrade

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $3,708.0018.00 $206.00
Supervisor II $6,303.0033.00 $191.00

$10,011.00Professional Services Subtotal:
Sub-Contractors Charge

Board of Regents $1,257.61
$1,257.61Sub-Contractors Subtotal:

$11,268.61Model Transfer & Upgrade Subtotal:
07 - Imported Water: Engineering & Analysis

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $2,575.0012.50 $206.00
Associate III $3,496.5031.50 $111.00
GIS Specialist I $429.254.25 $101.00
Assistant I $3,087.0031.50 $98.00
Administrative I $36.000.50 $72.00

$9,623.75Professional Services Subtotal:

$9,623.75Imported Water: Engineering & Analysis Subtotal:
08 - Imported Water: Negotiations & Coordination

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $355.501.50 $237.00
Supervisor I $309.001.50 $206.00
Associate III $388.503.50 $111.00

$1,053.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$1,053.00Imported Water: Negotiations & Coordination Subtotal:
09 - Recycled Water

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $592.502.50 $237.00
Supervisor I $927.004.50 $206.00
Associate III $527.254.75 $111.00
Assistant I $588.006.00 $98.00

$2,634.75Professional Services Subtotal:

$2,634.75Recycled Water Subtotal:
10 - Stakeholder Coordination

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Senior Associate $128.001.00 $128.00
$128.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$128.00Stakeholder Coordination Subtotal:
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11 - Data Collection, Monitoring & Data Gaps
Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $237.001.00 $237.00
Supervisor I $927.004.50 $206.00
Senior Associate $64.000.50 $128.00
Associate I $884.507.25 $122.00
GIS Manager $244.002.00 $122.00
Senior Assistant $5,175.7550.25 $103.00

$7,532.25Professional Services Subtotal:
Reimbursables Charge

Car Rental $740.47
Field Supplies $44.65
Lodging $137.52
Meals $72.98
Mileage $3.85
Overnight Mail $16.98

$1,016.45Reimbursables Subtotal:
Sub-Contractors Charge

Horizon Environmental, Inc. $300.00
$300.00Sub-Contractors Subtotal:

$8,848.70Data Collection, Monitoring & Data Gaps Subtotal:
12 - Prop 1 SDAC Program Support

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $463.502.25 $206.00
Senior Associate $64.000.50 $128.00
Associate III $971.258.75 $111.00
Assistant I $3,332.0034.00 $98.00

$4,830.75Professional Services Subtotal:

$4,830.75Prop 1 SDAC Program Support Subtotal:
14 - Production Reporting, Transient Pool & Fee Support

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Associate III $83.250.75 $111.00
$83.25Professional Services Subtotal:

$83.25Production Reporting, Transient Pool & Fee Support Subtotal:
17 - Navy/Coso Royalty Fund: Develop FY23 Projects & Secure Funding

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $355.501.50 $237.00
$355.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$355.50Navy/Coso Royalty Fund: Develop FY23 Projects & Secure Funding Subtotal:
18 - Navy/Coso Royalty Fund: FY21 Rose Valley MW Permitting, Bid Doc Support & Dr

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor II $573.003.00 $191.00
$573.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$573.00Navy/Coso Royalty Fund: FY21 Rose Valley MW Permitting, Bid Doc Support & Dr
20 - Shallow Well Mitigation Program: Outreach & Impacts Evaluation

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $1,066.504.50 $237.00
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20 - Shallow Well Mitigation Program: Outreach & Impacts Evaluation
Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Senior Assistant $128.751.25 $103.00
$1,195.25Professional Services Subtotal:

$1,195.25Shallow Well Mitigation Program: Outreach & Impacts Evaluation Subtotal:
21 - General Engineering

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $1,066.504.50 $237.00
Supervisor I $154.500.75 $206.00
GIS Manager $549.004.50 $122.00

$1,770.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$1,770.00General Engineering Subtotal:
22 - Coordination with DWR on GSP Review

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $948.004.00 $237.00
Supervisor I $51.500.25 $206.00
Senior Associate $192.001.50 $128.00

$1,191.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$1,191.50Coordination with DWR on GSP Review Subtotal:
23 - Annual Report Preparation

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Supervisor I $721.003.50 $206.00
Supervisor II $5,825.5030.50 $191.00

$6,546.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$6,546.50Annual Report Preparation Subtotal:
24 - Review of Ramboll Report

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $237.001.00 $237.00
$237.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$237.00Review of Ramboll Report Subtotal:
25 - Allocation Plan & Rules & Regs on Pumping/Restrictions

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $355.501.50 $237.00
$355.50Professional Services Subtotal:

$355.50Allocation Plan & Rules & Regs on Pumping/Restrictions Subtotal:
26 - Budget Support

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Senior Associate $96.000.75 $128.00
$96.00Professional Services Subtotal:

$96.00Budget Support Subtotal:
27 - Litigation Support

Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Principal $2,725.5011.50 $237.00
Supervisor I $1,545.007.50 $206.00
Senior Associate $1,248.009.75 $128.00
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27 - Litigation Support
Professional Services ChargeBill RateBill Hours

Associate I $122.001.00 $122.00
GIS Manager $61.000.50 $122.00
Senior Assistant $128.751.25 $103.00
Assistant I $1,249.5012.75 $98.00

$7,079.75Professional Services Subtotal:

$7,079.75Litigation Support Subtotal:

Water Resources Management 2022 Subtotal: $86,535.52

$86,535.52*** Invoice Total ***



9

8 4

6 0

Date Units Unit Rate Charge Notes

06/30/2022  212.00 $31.80$0.15

Reimbursables
Description

Reproduction

Reproduction (Color) 06/30/2022  144.00 $128.16$0.89

$159.96Meetings & Prep Sub-Total:

Date Units Unit Rate Charge Notes

Sub-Contractors
Description

Board of Regents 06/30/2022  1.00 $1,257.61$1,257.61

$1,257.61Model Transfer & Upgrade Sub-Total:

11 - Data Collection, Monitoring & Data Gaps

Reimbursables
Description Date Units Unit Rate Charge Notes

Mileage 06/18/2022  3.10 $1.78$0.58

Car Rental 06/20/2022  1.00 $100.00$100.00

Field Supplies 06/20/2022  1.00 $17.86$17.86

Field Supplies 06/20/2022  1.00 $26.79$26.79

Meals 06/20/2022  1.00 $15.69$15.69

Meals 06/20/2022  1.00 $9.43$9.43

Meals 06/20/2022  1.00 $3.34$3.34

Meals 06/20/2022  1.00 $7.28$7.28

Meals 06/20/2022  1.00 $7.49$7.49

Meals 06/20/2022  1.00 $6.00$6.00

Car Rental 06/21/2022  1.00 $100.00$100.00

Car Rental 06/21/2022  1.00 $52.44$52.44

Car Rental 06/21/2022  1.00 $488.03$488.03

Lodging 06/21/2022  1.00 $137.52$137.52

Meals 06/21/2022  1.00 $9.15$9.15

Meals 06/21/2022  1.00 $12.40$12.40

Meals 06/21/2022  1.00 $2.20$2.20

06/21/2022  3.60 $2.07$0.58

06/27/2022  1.00 $16.98$16.98

Date Units Unit Rate Charge Notes

Mileage

Overnight Mail

Sub-Contractors
Description

Horizon Environmental, Inc. 06/30/2022  1.00 $300.00$300.00

$1,316.45Data Collection, Monitoring & Data Gaps Sub-Total:







Invoice for Stetson Enginners Project # 2652-2002-06

INVOICE TO
INVOICE NUMBER:

Stetson Engineers Inc
Attn:   Accounts   Payable DATE:
2171 East Francisco Blvd., Suite K
San Rafael, CA 94901 AMOUNT:

Terms:

Period Billed

Project #2652-2002-06 From To

Net Amount:  72,000.00  Total  (Not to exceed)

DRI Account #  GR15120  / AWD-06-00000914  /  RC0030
PI :  Bacon, Steve

Cost Elements/Services Current Cumulative

Stetson Engineers Project #2652-2002-06

Salary: Hours Rate Current Cumulative

Bacon, Steve 0.0000 166.37 0.00 6,276.72

Chapman, Jenny 0.0000 188.67 0.00 0.00

Rybarski, Susan 14.0092 89.77 1,257.61 1,257.61

Travel: 0.00

Operating: 0.00 0.00

Total 1,257.61 7,534.33

Total Amount Due This Invoice 1,257.61

Budget Amount  Task  01 : 72,000.00     
Invoiced To Date : 7,534.33

Budget  Balance - Task  01 : 64,465.67     

07/11/22
Kathy Rodriguez, Accounting Assistant II Date
(775) 673-7476
          Make Check Payable To:  Board of Regents Mail Check To: Desert Research Institute

Financial  Services  Office
2215 Raggio Parkway
Reno, Nevada    89512-1095

           * Please return Invoice Copy with Check * Tax I.D. # 886000024

 "I certify to the best of my ability that all expenditures reported are for appropriate purposes and in accordance with the provisions of the award document."

CI-06-7295   /  03

07/11/22

$1,257.61

Net 30 Days

Contract/Grant/Agreement/Purchase Order

6/1/2022 6/30/2022



Nichole Weedman 06/22/2022

Ridgecrest, CA 6/20/22 - 6/21/2022

6/20/22 6/21/22

$137.52

$488.03

$252.44

--

--

Home Depot: 26.79
                     17.86
see note below

Popeyes: 9.15 

The Barn: 2.20
Starbucks: 12.40

Stater Bros: 3.34
Papa John's: 15.69

Subway: 7.28
Shell: 7.49

Starbucks: 6:00
McDonald's: 9.43

6/18/2022 Place of residence Enterprise 3.1

6/21/2022 Enterprise Place of residence 3.6

6.7

$3.85

$30.03
$23.92
$19.03

$44.65

$999.47

$999.47
$999.47

6/22/2022

Home Depot - purchase of equipment to replace KCWA transducers with Solinst dataloggers and equipment to effectively complete well assessment



Map data ©2022 Google 2000 ft 

Explore Enterprise Rent-A-Car

9 min

2.6 miles

via Black Mountain Rd

Fastest route now due to tra c
conditions

10 min

3.1 miles

via I-15 S

Heavy tra c, as usual

Restaurants Hotels Gas stations Parking Lots More

Drive 2.6 miles, 9 minHome (9815 Jake Ln) to Enterprise Rent-A-Car, 9292 Miramar Rd #28, San Diego, CA 92126
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Map data ©2022 Google 2000 ft 

Explore 9815 Jake Ln

8 min

3.6 miles

via I-15 N

Fastest route now due to tra c
conditions

10 min

2.6 miles

via Black Mountain Rd

13 min

4.2 miles

via Camino Ruiz and Mira Mesa
Blvd

Restaurants Hotels Gas stations Parking Lots More

Drive 3.6 miles, 8 minEnterprise Rent-A-Car, 9292 Miramar Rd #28, San Diego, CA 92126 to Home (9815 Jake Ln)





Invoice
Date

6/30/2022
Invoice #

13775

Bill To:
Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority
100 W California Ave
Ridgecrest, CA 93555

P.O. No. Due Date

8/15/2022

Inv Sent

7/20/2022

Total

PO Box 1350
Carmel Valley, CA 93924

Description AmountDate
Reimbursable Expenses for City of Ridgecrest Monthly 
Rent  ($300) - please see attached

300.006/30/2022

$300.00



AGREEMENT FOR LEASE OF 
100 W. CALIFORNIA AVENUE, RIDGECREST, CA 

 
by and between 

 
THE CITY OF RIDGECREST AND 

REGIONAL GOVERNMENT SERVICES 
 

AGREEMENT: 
 

Premises:  For and in consideration of the terms, covenants, and conditions contained in this 
Agreement, City leases to RGS, and RGS leases from City, an approximate 210 square foot 
office space located along with the monthly use of the City’s conference room located at 100 
W. California Avenue., Ridgecrest, County of Kern, State of California, depicted on the floor 
plan attached as Exhibit “A” (“Premises”). 

 
Term: The initial term of this Agreement (“Term”) shall commence on the Execution Date 
and terminate one year (12 months) thereafter, unless sooner terminated or extended as 
provided in this Agreement. 

 
Option to Extend Term: Provided RGS is not in default of any of the terms, covenants, or 
conditions of this Agreement, RGS shall have one option to request an extension of the 
initial Term for a two-year period (“Option Term”).  RGS may exercise the option by 
giving the City’s City Manager (“CM”) written notice of RGS’s desire to extend, not less 
than 60 days prior to expiration of the initial Term.  The CM, at the CM’s sole discretion, 
may accept or reject the request to extend. 

 
 

 
4. Right to Terminate:   Either Party may terminate this Agreement for any reason by 

providing a 60-day prior written notice to the other Party. 
 
5. Hold Over:  If RGS holds over after the expiration of the Term, with the express or 

implied consent of City, such holding over shall be a tenancy only from month to month and shall be 
governed by the terms, covenants, and conditions contained in this Agreement.  
 

6. Rental Consideration:  
 

a. In General: As consideration for the lease of the Premises during the Term, RGS 
shall pay to City in lawful money of the United States, to CM at 100 W. CALIFORNIA AVENUE, 
RIDGECREST, CA, or to such persons and at such places as may be designated from time to time by 
City. The first rental payment shall be paid within 30 days of the Execution Date, and thereafter for the 
balance of the Term, shall be paid on or before the first of each month. In the event RGS occupies the 
Premises for a partial month at any time, RGS shall only be responsible for a prorated portion of the 
Rent. 

 
b. Fair Market Rental Value:  The fair market rental rate of the facility is 

determined to be $300 per month ($1.43 per square foot).   

RGSLaptop5CG732316C
Highlight





Invoice
Date

6/30/2022
Invoice #

13675

Bill To:
Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority
100 W California Ave
Ridgecrest, CA 93555

P.O. No. Due Date

7/30/2022

Inv Sent

7/14/2022

Total

PO Box 1350
Carmel Valley, CA 93924

Description AmountDate
Contract Services for June - please see attached 25,636.216/30/2022

$25,636.21



Month:  

Monthly
Advisor Reg Hrs Bill Rate Reg Hrs Bill Rate Total Billed

CT 26.50 130.00$  18.50 130.00$  5,850.00$    

AK 71.60 105.00$  45.30 105.00$  12,274.50$  

JK 0.00 -$        1.00 137.00$  137.00$       

GL 0.00 -$        0.00 -$        -$            

GS 26.83 137.00$  27.00 137.00$  7,374.71$    

RM 0.00 -$        0.00 -$        -$            

Totals 124.93 91.80 25,636.21$  

Indian Wells Valley

Jun, 2022

Hours and Rates by Pay Period
1st -15th 16th - EOM

Indian Wells 7/11/2022



Client Activity Report
June 2022

Client Task Comment Hours
Client Hours 216.73Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority
Task Hours 144.204070-000 - IWVGA General Administration

GA staff meeting; review and respond to email 2.006/1/2022
Email correspondence with staff Board meeting prep IWVGA Staff call RFP 
correspondence

5.006/1/2022

Email correspondence with staff Call with staff member Board meeting prep RFP 
correspondence RFP conference call

7.506/2/2022

Prepare and send mgt representation letter to auditor; attend risk assessment 
meeting (City); discussion re C&E plan; various emails

1.506/2/2022

Email correspondence with staff Board meeting prep Litigation assistance Call with 
staff member

6.706/3/2022

Review meter specs and proposals for grant work; review board agenda; review 
audit report; identify budget for C&E plan; review and respond to various emails

2.006/3/2022

Prepare C&E staff report; review final agenda and packet items 1.506/4/2022
Board meeting prep Email correspondence with staff 2.306/4/2022
Email correspondence with staff Board packet posting / distribution 0.706/5/2022
Email correspondence with staff Board meeting prep RGS staff call Call with 
constituent Document review / distribution Transient Pool spreadsheet updates 
Litigation assistance

8.006/6/2022

GA team meeting, general admin and review and respond t emails 2.006/6/2022
Email correspondence with staff Board meeting prep Call with staff member 
Litigation support RFP correspondence

6.506/7/2022

Review CRWA proposals, legislative info, and various emails 1.006/7/2022
Travel to and from and attend GA pre-meeting and board meeting 8.256/8/2022
IWVGA meeting Email correspondence with staff Minutes 7.006/8/2022
Meet w/CRWA and meter rep re meter change proposals; review and respond to 
various emails; staff de-brief meeting

3.256/9/2022

Email correspondence with staff Agenda/action register updates Conference call 
with staff

3.206/9/2022

Review and respond to emails 0.506/10/2022
Email correspondence with staff RFP correspondence Litigation support Call with 
staff member

3.506/10/2022

Email correspondence with staff RGS staff team call Meeting coordination RFP 
correspondence

5.006/13/2022

GA team call; develop initial C&E work plan; review and respond to various emails 2.006/13/2022
General admin; review and respond to various emails 1.006/14/2022
Email correspondence with staff RFP correspondence 2.006/14/2022
Review RFP timing and process for approvals; review documents and information; 
meeting coordination; review and respond to various emails.

1.506/15/2022

Email correspondence with staff RFP correspondence Meeting coordination 3.006/15/2022
Call w/DWR re grant agreement; call w/City and legal re billing; review and 
respond to various emails

2.256/16/2022

Email correspondence with staff Minutes DWR conference call Conference call 5.606/16/2022
Execute new Letter of Intent for water purchase; draft material for C&E; review 
and respond to various emails

1.506/17/2022

Email correspondence with staff Call with staff member Document prep PAC 
Meeting prep RFP WIP

4.006/17/2022

Review and respond to emails 0.506/20/2022



Client Activity Report
June 2022

Client Task Comment Hours
Email correspondence  PAC Agenda posting / distribution Call with staff member 1.206/20/2022
Review and respond to various emails; document review; C&E materials 1.006/21/2022
Call w/legal counsel; various emails and general admin 1.506/22/2022
Document review Email correspondence with well owner Call with constituent PAC 
Meeting prep

1.506/22/2022

PAC meeting prep 1.006/23/2022
Call w/ CCG re WRDA; work on C&E materials; attend PAC meeting 3.256/23/2022
Call w/CCG and legal re leg matters; review and respond to various emails 2.006/24/2022
Monthly Report Forms 2.606/24/2022
GA team meeting; review and respond to emails 1.506/27/2022
Email correspondence with staff RGS team call Document review Call with 
constituent Shallow well assistance

6.806/27/2022

Call w/CCG and legal re water purchase update; meeting coordination; review and 
respond to emails

1.006/28/2022

Email correspondence with staff Call with constituent Shallow well assistance RFP 
WIP meeting coordination

3.506/28/2022

GA staff calls; meeting coordination; various emails 2.006/29/2022
Email correspondence with staff Call with constituent Email correspondence with 
well owner Shallow well assistance Conference calls with staff Meeting 
coordination Document review

8.306/29/2022

Email correspondence with staff Call with WH Conference call Call with staff 
member

5.806/30/2022

Review revised meter proposals; review and respond to various emails 0.506/30/2022

Task Hours 65.534070-001 - IWVGA Finance
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP 2.006/1/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP 0.506/3/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Financials WIP 5.506/5/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: RGS Staff Meeting; Audit WIP 1.836/6/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP 1.506/7/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Board Meeting; Audit WIP 3.506/8/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: IWVGA Staff Meeting 1.006/9/2022
Payment processing 3.006/10/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP 2.506/10/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: RGS Staff Meeting; Audit WIP 3.006/13/2022
Invoice Tracker updates Audit WIP 2.306/13/2022
Voucher requests Payment processing Invoice tracker updates 5.506/14/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Grants WIP; Audit WIP 2.506/14/2022
Voucher Requests 0.406/15/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Stetson Grant Meeting; Grant WIP; Meeting w/COR; Audit WIP 3.256/16/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP; Financials WIP 3.506/17/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP 1.006/20/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP 1.756/21/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP 2.006/22/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP 2.506/23/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: RGS Staff Meeting; Audit WIP 2.756/27/2022



Client Activity Report
June 2022

Client Task Comment Hours
Staff mtg 1.006/27/2022
Payment processing 3.506/28/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP; Financials WIP 3.006/28/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: IWVGA Staff Meeting; Audit WIP; Financials WIP 1.506/29/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: Audit WIP; Financials WIP 3.256/30/2022
Payment processing 1.506/30/2022

Task Hours 2.754070-002 - IWVGA Bond Issuance
GS:RGS/IWVGA: Financing Meeting 1.256/30/2022
Calls w/Wulff Hansen and staff re financing 1.506/30/2022

Task Hours 4.254070-003 - IWVGA MIP Implementation
GS: RGS/IWVGA: MIP WIP 0.506/7/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: MIP WIP 1.006/8/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: MIP WIP 1.506/13/2022
GS: RGS/IWVGA: MIP WIP 0.756/22/2022
GS:RGS/IWVGA: MIP WIP 0.506/28/2022





Capitol Core Group, Inc.
205 Cartwheel Bend (Operations Dept.)
Austin, TX  78738 US
512.568.3084
operations@capitolcore.com
www.capitolcore.com

BILL TO
Indian Wells Valley Groundwater 
Authority
500 West Ridgecrest Blvd.
Ridgecrest, California  93555
USA

INVOICE 2022-034

DATE 08/01/2022    TERMS Net 45

DUE DATE 09/15/2022

VENDOR ID INVOICE PERIOD
195953 July 2022

DATE ACCOUNT SUMMARY AMOUNT

07/05/2022 Balance Forward 14,025.00
Other payments and credits after 07/05/2022 through 07/31/2022 0.00

08/01/2022 Other invoices from this date 0.00
New charges (details below) 11,425.00
Total Amount Due 25,450.00

ACTIVITY HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Charges
Task 1:  Secure Imported Water Supplies
Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask A:  Internal clients meetings and internal strategy meetings re: 
Private Seller 2 and Agency 1 {McKinney}

1 250.00 250.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask A:  Negotiations with Private Seller-2 {Tatum}

5.50 250.00 1,375.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask B: Internal Strategy calls, client calls, and agreement discussion 
points {Tatum}

2.50 250.00 625.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask C:  Regulatory approval strategy, document drafting, review, and 
begin discussions with DWR {Tatum}

3 250.00 750.00

Government Relations:Intergovernmental Affairs
Subtask A:  LOI Negotiations Private Seller-2 {Simonetti}

6.25 225.00 1,406.25

Total Task 1: $4,406.25 (18.25 hours)
Task 2:  Secure Federal Funding Sources
Government Relations:Federal
Agency:  Interior -- Bureau of  Reclamation:  Title XVI and Drought 
Resiliency Programs:  Scoping Meetings w/ BOR, Internal Memorandum 
Development, client meetings, and follow-up {McKinney}

5.50 250.00 1,375.00



ACTIVITY HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Government Relations:Federal
Congressional:  Senate -- WRDA-22 Senate Floor and Passage {McKinney}

1.50 250.00 375.00

Government Relations:Federal
Congressional:  NDAA and WRDA Language follow-up {Simonetti}

3.50 225.00 787.50

Government Relations:Federal
Agency:  BOR Title XVI discussion {Simonetti}

2.50 225.00 562.50

Government Relations:Federal
Congressional: Wastewater Treatment Plant:  Senate FY2023 NDAA 
advocacy

2 225.00 450.00

Total Task 2: $3,550.00 (15 hours)
Task 3: Secure State Funding Sources
Government Relations:California
Agency:  Resources -- DWR:  SGMA-IP Round 2 Allocations call 
{McKinney}

1 250.00 250.00

Government Relations:California
Agency:  Wastewater Treatment Plant:  Follow-up with State Water 
Resources Control Board {Simonetti}

4 225.00 900.00

Total Task 3: $1,150.00 (5 hours)
Task 4: Administration and Reporting
Administrative
July Board Meeting Preparation {McKinney}

1 250.00 250.00

Administrative
Meetings:  July Board Meeting (open/closed sessions) {Tatum}

3 250.00 750.00

Administrative
Meetings:  July Special Board Meeting {Tatum}

1 250.00 250.00

Administrative
Reporting:  Monthly Materials Preparation {Simonetti}

1.25 225.00 281.25

Administrative
Meeting:  Special Board Meeting {Simonetti}

2 225.00 450.00

Administrative
Reporting:  Special Board Meeting Preparation {Simonetti}

1.50 225.00 337.50

Total Task 4: $2,318.75 (9.75 hours)
---------------------------------------
Compliance Reporting Notes:
Federal Reporting WWTP (this invoice) $450.00
Federal Reporting IWVGA (this invoice) $3,100.00
State Reporting WWTP (this invoice) $900.00
State Reporting IWVG (this invoice) $250.00
---------------------------------------

Thank you for your business.  Please make checks payable to 
Capitol Core Group, Inc.

TOTAL OF NEW 
CHARGES 11,425.00

TOTAL DUE $25,450.00





 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
August 5, 2022 
 
Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority 
Attn: Carol Thomas-Keefer 
500 W. Ridgecrest Blvd 
Ridgecrest, CA 93555 
 
Dear Carol: 
 
Provided is our report and invoice for July 1, 2022 – July 31, 2022. This information pertains to the Task #6 of 
Addendum No. 1 for Agreement 03-19. Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions, comments, or 
concerns; my contact information is listed below.  
 
The packet includes the following: 

 Invoice & Details 
 Timesheets 
 Expense Forms 
 Progress Report 

 
Sincerely, 

 
 
 

Dustin Hardwick 
Deputy Director 
California Rural Water Association 
1234 N. Market Boulevard 
Sacramento, CA 95834 
Phone: (760) 920-0842 
Email: dhardwick@calruralwater.org 
 



 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

I. Invoice & Detail Cost  



July 2022

To: Indian Wells Valley Groundwater Authority Invoice #: IWVGA-Task#6-004
Attn: Carol Thomas-Keefer Invoice Date: 8/5/2022
500 W. Ridgecrest Blvd Terms: Net 30 Days
Ridgecrest CA, 93555

Pay: California Rural Water Association
1234 North Market Blvd.
Sacramento, CA 95834

Project Name: IWVGA Task #6 Agreement 03-19 Addendum No. 1

Work Plan/AR # Description of work Date Cost
Admin and project support Invoice period 571.50$                          
Technician Admin/Onsite Invoice period 2,287.50$                       
Technician Travel Hours Invoice period 1,922.50$                       

Cost
533.71$                          
414.03$                          
309.28$                          

Cost

6,038.52$                       

Submitted by:
Dustin Hardwick, Deputy Director Signature
California Rural Water Association

8/5/2022
Date

INVOICE TOTAL:

Milage, Meals, Lodging
Milage, Meals, Lodging
Milage, Meals, LodgingMichael Sims

Abel Silva
Mark Hardison

Travel Expenditures
Name

Task 6

Description of Travel

Task 6

Name Description of Equipment
Equipment

Task 6

IWVGA-Searles Valley Water District

California Rural Water Association
Task #6 Additional Conservation and Drought Mngmt Planning

INVOICE



Invoice # Amount
IWVGA-Task#6-001 $20,653.50
IWVGA-Task#6-002 $19,615.13
IWVGA-Task#6-003 $9,019.71
IWVGA-Task#6-004 $6,038.52

Total $55,326.86

Expenditure Tracking



Date of Invoice or Receipt Description Rate Hours
Amount this Invoice 
for PM and Admin

A. Personnel Name of Employee
For All Dates within Invoice Period Dustin Hardwick $75 3  $    225.00 
For All Dates within Invoice Period Jacob DeLuna $33 10.5  $    346.50 
For All Dates within Invoice Period
For All Dates within Invoice Period
For All Dates within Invoice Period

A. Subtotal = 13.50  $    571.50 
C. Equipment Description of Equipment

B. Subtotal =  $    -  
C. Travel Expenitures Description of Expendatures

C. Subtotal = -$   
D. Travel Hours Description of Travel (when, where, why, who, type of expense, etc.)

-$   
-$   
-$   

D. Subtotal = 0 -$   
E. Professional and Consultant Services Name of Consultant 

E. Subtotal = 571.50$    

Revised 8/16/16

IWVGA-Task #6
Invoice Detail
***** Below should reflect all direct Admin Costs (costs  tied to Task #6) from July 2022:



Date of Invoice or Receipt Description Rate Hours
Amount this Invoice 
for PM and Admin

A. Personnel Name of Employee
For All Dates within Invoice Period Michael Sims $115 10.5  $    1,207.50 
For All Dates within Invoice Period Abel Silva $90 5  $    450.00 
For All Dates within Invoice Period Mark Hardison $90 7  $    630.00 
For All Dates within Invoice Period
For All Dates within Invoice Period
For All Dates within Invoice Period
For All Dates within Invoice Period

A. Subtotal = 22.50  $    2,287.50 
C. Equipment Description of Equipment

B. Subtotal = $0.00 

Michael Sims Milage, Lodging, meals 533.71$    
Abel Silva Milage, Lodging, meals 414.03$    
Mark Hardison Milage, Lodging, meals 309.28$    

C. Subtotal = 1,257.02$    
D. Travel Hours Description of Travel (when, where, why, who, type of expense, etc.)
Michael Sims Travel to Zenner HQ for tour and meter inspection $115 8.5 977.50$    
Abel Silva Travel to Zenner HQ for tour and meter inspection $90 7.5 675.00$    
Mark Hardison Travel to Zenner HQ for tour and meter inspection $90 3 270.00$    

D. Subtotal = 19 1,922.50$    
E. Professional and Consultant Services Name of Consultant 

E. Subtotal = 5,467.02$    

Revised 8/16/16

IWVGA-Task #6
Invoice Detail
***** Below should reflect all direct Technician Costs (costs  tied to Task #6) from July 2022: 



 
 

 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

II. Timesheets  



First Name Last Name Job Code Date hours notes
Jacob DeLuna Admin 7/1/2022 0.25 Admin Support
Jacob DeLuna Admin 7/4/2022 1.25 Expense form filing from technicians
Jacob DeLuna Admin 7/6/2022 1.5 Invoice packet prep for Friday 7/8
Jacob DeLuna Admin 7/7/2022 1.5 Invoice packet prep
Jacob DeLuna Admin 7/8/2022 1 Invoice submittal inquiry to IWVGA
Jacob DeLuna Admin 7/13/2022 1.5 Proposal document created and sent to iFlow
Jacob DeLuna Admin 7/19/2022 0.5 Meter purchase inquiry follow up
Jacob DeLuna Admin 7/20/2022 0.25 Admin support
Jacob DeLuna Admin 7/21/2022 0.25 Proposal to iFlow follow-up
Jacob DeLuna Admin 7/22/2022 0.5 Program update to Bianca
Jacob DeLuna Admin 7/26/2022 0.25 Admin Support
Jacob DeLuna Admin 7/27/2022 1.25 Past due invoice follow up
Jacob DeLuna Admin 7/29/2022 0.5 Admin support
Total Travel: 0 Total Personel: 10.5

First Name Last Name Job Code Date hours notes
Dustin Hardwick Admin 7/6/2022 1 Project Support
Dustin Hardwick Admin 7/19/2022 1 Project Support
Dustin Hardwick Admin 7/27/2022 1 Project Support
Total Travel: 0 Total Personel: 3



First Name Last Name Job Code Date hours notes
Michael Sims Admin 7/26/2022 1.5 Admin
Michael Sims On-Site 7/26/2022 3 Admin-meter change out, working with Gene at iFlow

Michael Sims Travel 7/26/2022 4.5 Admin-meter change out, working with Gene at iFlow

Michael Sims On-Site 7/27/2022 3 Admin-meter change out, working with Gene at iFlow

Michael Sims Travel 7/27/2022 4 Admin

Michael Sims Admin 7/28/2022 1 Working with Gene iflow on meter quote revision
Michael Sims Admin 7/29/2022 2 Calling system for more meter information

Total Travel: 8.5 Total Personel: 10.5

First Name Last Name Job Code Date hours Admin-catch up call with Jacob
Abel Silva Travel 7/26/2022 1.5 team meeting
Abel Silva Admin 7/26/2022 2.5 home to inyokern csd
Abel Silva Travel 7/26/2022 3 Drought tolerance 
Abel Silva Admin 7/27/2022 2.5 Inyokern CSD to Home
Abel Silva Travel 7/27/2022 3 Meter replacement meeting
Total Travel: 7.5 Total Personel: 5

First Name Last Name Job Code Date hours notes
Mark Hardison Travel 7/26/2022 1.5 Travel from Home Office to Inyokern for Drought Preparedness Meeting. Travel to Hotel in Ridgecrest.

Mark Hardison On-Site 7/26/2022 4.5
Drought Preparedness Meeting. 3.0
Team Meeting. 1.5

Mark Hardison Travel 7/27/2022 1.5 Travel from Hotel in Ridgecrest to Inyokern for Meter presentation Meeting. Travel back to Home Office.
Mark Hardison On-Site 7/27/2022 2.5 Meter presentation Meeting
Total Travel: 3 Total Personel: 7



III. Expense Forms



California Rural Water Association 
1234 N. Market St. 

Sacramento, CA 95834 

2022 TRAVEL EXPENSE REPORT-July 1st

Program: JWVGA-Workshops 1Period: July 26-27, 2022 

Name: Michael Sims 

Address to mail check: 12842 Casa Ct. 

City I State I Zip: Poway, CA 92064 

Purpose of trip(s): 1st Day Water Conservation/Drought Plans 
2nd Day Meter change-out/installation with iFlow-Gene & Golden Meter 

SOP-Q/A 

Per Diem Calculation 
Total# of Quarters (From Details Sheet): 

2 X 14.75 29.50 
3 X 16.00 48.00 
0 X 17.25 0.00 
0 X 18.50 0.00 
0 X 19.75 0.00 

Total Per Diem» $77.50 

Personal Vehicle Mileage 

Total Mileage: 495 X $0.625 per mile 
(From Details Sheet) Total Mileage» $309.06 

Miscellaneous Expenses 
LodAinA 147.15 
Phone 0.00 
Air Fare 0.00 
Rental Car/ Taxi 0.00 
Rental Car/ Taxi 0.00 
Postage 0.00 
Supplies 0.00 
Other 0.00

Total Personal Out-Of-Pocket Miscellaneous >> $147.15 

Total Amcwnt of Reimbursement: = $533.71 
___.,_A/ J ,-,_ /J // ... / I

Employee Signature: /�/"//J � /.-,,Y/,,,J 1.-,f Date: / /1'0/ ..22 
-'-

l I/- ·�
. . 

Approval Signature: \../ Date: 



->•-·:•··· . .a..· 

DATE 
7/26/22 
7/27/22 

TOTALS 

DATE 

7/26/22 
7/26/22 
7/27/22 
7/27/22 

'·• L .. - .. -·-· -:__ , ............
sx,o:ems'ell!l'e'.taii ,��

.•· .:, -�·,,= 

Per Diem Detail (Quarters) 
$14.75 $16.00 $17.25 $18.50 $19.75 HIGH COST CITY OR COUNTY 

1 1 lnyokern/Ridgecrest 
1 2 Ridgecrest/lnyokern 

2 3 0 0 0 

Mileage Detail 
START FINISH TOTAL REASON 

0 238 238 To lnyokern CSD 
0 9 9 To Hotel 

0 9 9 To lnyokern CSD 
0 239 239 7 o Home 

Total Mileage: 495 

I 

.... ,.,._,,.. . � :-: :.�· 
,, .·.: 

DATE AMOUNT 

Lodging 

26-Jul $ 147.15 

Phone/Wifi 

Air Fare 

Car Rental / Taxi 

Car Rental / Taxi 

Postage 

Supplies 

Other 









































IV. Progress Report



IWVGA June/July 2022 Report (Michael Sims – Lead Leak Detection Specialist) 

June 21 Zenner Factory Tour with Team and Gene McMillian (iFlow) educational purposes  

June 22 Prepping documents for meeting with team and water systems. I’ve been communicating with the 
four systems and scheduling a workshop to meet and discuss further information. Inyokern CSD (Bonnie) has 
committed to opening their facility for these two workshops in July. She did a great job in providing a 
convenient and comfortable place for all the water systems to meet and greet for our workshops on: Water 
Conservation/Drought and Meter change out procedures. 

Each of these four systems have been very helpful and excited in what’s happening with the extension. 
Gathering much more information from iFlow-Gene McMillian on Zenner and AXIOMA ultra-smart meters. 
Received proposal quote for all meter change out, installation, parts and software from iFlow and reviewed. 
My many questions which will be answered at the workshop in July along with each systems question’s. 

 
July 26 Workshop Meeting Onsite at Inyokern Community Service District 1st Day Water 
Conservation/Drought Plans Workshop – Inyokern CSD Office Mgr. Bonnie Minnis, China Lake Acres Mutual 
Water Company, East Inyokern MWC and West Valley MWC. I did a PowerPoint presentation on the subjects 
and showed the templates will be implementing? There was much interest and questions.  

 
July 26 Team Strategy Dinner Meeting- I have assigned each of the team a water system to oversee and help 
do these Drought/Conservation/Contingence templates Plans. 

 
July 27 Workshop Meeting Onsite at Inyokern Community Service District 2nd Day Meter change-
out/installation SOP-Q/A Onsite at Inyokern CSD with China Lake Acres Mutual Water Company, East 
Inyokern MWC and West Valley MWC. Meter Change-out Program. IFlow and Golder Meter Installers 
provided all the needed information and answered all question. Gathering much needed information on 
meters sizes, boxes, lids, valves, location, meter read out sheets and Gene asked for a Propaganda Study for 
the AMI software, etc.  
 
I’ve attached the sign in sheet. 
 

July 28 Gene has gathered all the meter sheets with addresses to do the propaganda study. 
 
July 29 I made sure all systems have everyone’s contact information to network for the future. 
 
Meter Installation Order submitted to iFlow: 

1. East Inyokern MWC 
2. West Valley MWC 
3. Inyokern CSD 
4. China Lake Acres MWC 

 
iFlow is in review of proposal set forth by CRWA for payment method, order expected to be executed by 
August 12th.  

 



 

July 26 with 1 person representing their system 

  

 

July 27 with a few more per system and installers in back row. 

 

*Sign in sheet for class attendees located on next page 
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